





COMPILATION OF LAWS
ENACTED UNDER THE
EXPRESS POWERS ACT
BY THE
COUNTY COUNCIL OF
PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

2015

Council Members

DERRICK LEON DAVIS
MEL FRANKLIN
DANNIELLE M. GLAROS
ANDREA C. HARRISON
MARY A. LEHMAN
OBIE PATTERSON
DENI L. TAVERAS
KAREN R. TOLES
TODD M. TURNER









TABLE 1

Bill Number Chapter Bill Number Chapter
CB-1 1 CB-52 40
CB-2 2 CB-53 41
CB-3 4 CB-54 --
CB-4 3 CB-55 --
CB-5 6 CB-56 -
CB-6 5 CB-57 -
CB-7 12 CB-58 88
CB-8 10 CB-59 46
CB-9 7 CB-60 42

CB-10 - CB-61 -

CB-11 8 CB-62 56
CB-12 9 CB-63 69
CB-13 26 CB-64 43
CB-14 - CB-65 --

CB-15 - CB-66 35
CB-16 36 CB-67 52
CB-17 37 CB-68 53
CB-18 - CB-69 57
CB-19 22 CB-70 47
CB-20 14 CB-71 70
CB-21 28 CB-72 48
CB-22 29 CB-73 58
CB-23 23 CB-74 i
CB-24 15 CB-75 72
CB-25 24 CB-76 --

CB-26 16 CB-77 73
CB-27 25 CB-78 -

CB-28 -- CB-79 59
CB-29 51 CB-80 74
CB-30 39 CB-81 60
CB-31 11 CB-82 75
CB-32 13 CB-83 44
CB-33 27 CB-84 54
CB-34 67 CB-85 76
CB-35 17 CB-86 Firs
CB-36 18 CB-87 61
CB-37 19 CB-88 55
CB-38 20 CB-89 78
CB-39 21 CB-90 79
CB-40 -- CB-91 80
CB-41 30 CB-92 62

(Table 1 — Cont'd)



Bill Number

CB-42
CB-43
CB-44
CB-45
CB-46
CB-47
CB-48
CB-49
CB-50
CB-51

Chapter

45
32
68
31
34

33
86
87
38

Bill Number

CB-93
CB-94
CB-95
CB-96
CB-97
CB-98
CB-99
CB-100
CB-101
CB-102
CB-103
CB-104
CB-105
CB-106
CB-107










































these communities; and generally regarding Common
Ownership Communities.

L5







R = N U SO U SR N0 SN

[\_)[\_]l—ub—lr—l»—ll-ﬂn—-lr—-nb-ar—nl—l
F-‘O\OOOHJO\LH-BU-)I\J'—"O

DR-2
COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-6-2015
Chapter No. 5

Proposed and Presented by ~ Council Members Lehman and Taveras

Introduced by Council Members Lehman, Taveras, Franklin, Davis and Glaros

Co-Sponsors

Date of Introduction March 31, 2015

BILL
AN ACT concerning
Coal Tar Pavement Products Ban
For the purpose of defining coal tar pavement products; prohibiting the use of coal tar pavement
products; prohibiting the sale of coal tar pavement products; providing for alternatives and
outreach of this Act; providing for and enforcement and penalties for violations of this Act; and
generally relating to coal tar pavement products.

WHEREAS, coal tar pavement product is a thick black or brown liquid that is a byproduct
of the carbonization of coal for the steel industry or the gasification of coal for the steel industry
or the gasification of coal to make coal gas; and

WHEREAS, coal tar pavement products are applied to asphalt and concrete surfaces and
are used to seal the following: parking lots, driveways, recreational trails, airport runways and
lots, and playgrounds to protect surfaces from sunli ght, water, debris, chemical spills and leaks;
and

WHEREAS, studies by the U.S. Geological Survey have identified coal-tar based sealcoat
as a major source of polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbon (PAH) contamination in urban areas for
large parts of the Nation. Several PAHs are suspected human carcinogens and are toxic to
aquatic life; and

WHEREAS, the estimated lifetime cancer risk is 38 times higher for people who live near a
coal tar pavement product for their lifetime; and

WHEREAS, cost effective coal tar free pavement products are available which are not

major sources of PAH contamination; and













Prince George's County Council

Agenda Jtem Summary
Meeting Date: 4/21/2015
Reference No.: CB-006-2015
Draft No.: 2
Proposer(s): Lehman, Taveras
Sponsor(s): Lehman, Taveras, Franklin, Davis, Glaros
Item Title: An Act concerning a Coal Tar Pavement Products Ban for the purpose of defining coal tar

pavement products; prohibiting the use of coal tar pavement products; prohibiting the sale of
coal tar pavement products; providing for alternatives and outreach of this Act; providing for
and enforcement and penalties for violations of this Act; and generally relating to coal tar
pavement products.

Drafter: Kathleen H. Canning, Legislative Officer
Resource Personnel: Matthew A. Dernoga,Policy Analyst District 1

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented: 3/3/2015 Executive Action: 5/1/2015 S
Committee Referral: 3/3/2015 - THE Effective Date: 6/16/2015
Committee Action: 3/26/2015 -FAV(A)

Date Introduced: 3/31/2015

Public Hearing: 4/21/2015 - 1:30 PM

Council Action (1) 4/21/2015 - ENACTED

Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:A, DT:A, KT:A, TT:A

Pass/Fail: P

Remarks:

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS:
19-150, 19-151, 19-152, 19-153, 19-154

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Transportation Housing and Environment Date 3/26/2015

Committee Vote: Favorable, 5-0 with amendments (In favor: Council Members Lehman, Turner, Glaros, Taveras and
Franklin)

CB-6-2015 concerns Coal Tar Pavement Products Ban for the purpose of defining coal tar pavement products;
prohibiting the use of coal tar pavement products; prohibiting the sale of coal tar products. This bill also provides
alternatives and outreach of this act; provides for enforcement and penalties for violations of this act.

Staff oriented the Committee along with all legislative comments.

Cherie Muller, Barbara Mahler, and Peter VanMeter of the United States Geological Survey; Jeff Selzer of The
District of Columbia’s Department of the Environment; Jim Foster of the Anacostia Watershed Society and Fred
Pinkney of the United States Fish and Wildlife Society provided additional information to the Committee and spoke
in support of the bill.




CB-006-2015(Draft 2) Page 2 of 2

The Office of Law finds the CB-6-2015 is in proper legislative form and saw no legal impediment to its adoption.

The Office of Audits & Investigations found that enactment of CB-6-2015 may have a minimal fiscal impact on the
County related to costs of educational and outreach campaigns; however costs may be absorbed within DoE’s
appropriated budget.

CB-6-2015 was amended as follows:
On page 3, in line 30, strike “Section 19-151” and substitute “Section 19-1527.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:

(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

This bill will ban the use and sale of coal tar in the County. In addition, the bill provides for alternatives, outreach,
enforcement and penalties for violations.

Section 19-151 of CB-6-2015 (DR-2) is effective July 1, 2015.
Section 19-152 of CB-6-2015 (DR-2) is effective January 1, 2016.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:







= W o

O 00 ~1 Oy W

10
11
12
13
14

16
17
18
19
20
21

23
24
25
26
2i
28

30
31

CB-5-2015 (DR-2)

percent of all polystyrene produced in the United States is recycled; and
WHEREAS, environmentally friendly and cost effective alternatives to the use of expanded
polystyrene are available, such as: reusable equipment (trays, cups and silverware) and the use
of paper and other products made from recycled content and which are also compostable,
biodegradable, and/or recyclable; and
WHEREAS, the regional jurisdictions of the District of Columbia and Montgomery
County have established an expanded polystyrene ban in their respective jurisdictions.
BY adding:
SUBTITLE 19. POLLUTION.
Sections 19-139, 19-140, 19-141,
19-142, 19-143, and 19-144,
The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).
SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Sections 19-139, 19-140, 19-141, 19-142, 19-143, and 19-144, of the
Prince George's County Code be and the same are hereby added:
SUBTITLE 19. POLLUTION.
DIVISION 5. EXPANDED POLYSTYRENE BAN.
Sec. 19-139. Definitions.
(@) For the purposes of this Act. the following terms shall mean:

(1) Expanded polystyrene means blown polystvrene and expanded and

extruded foams that are thermoplastic petrochemical materials utilizing a styrene monomer and
processed by a number of techniques. including fusion of polymer spheres (expandable bead

polystyrene). injection molding. foam molding. and extrusion-blow molding (extruded foam

polystyrene).

(2) Expanded polystyrene food service products means food containers.

plates. hot and cold beverage cups. meat and vegetable trays. eggo cartons and other products

made of expanded polystyvrene and used for selling, providing. or serving foods that are intended
by the manufacturer to be used once for eating or drinking or generally recognized by the public

as items to be discarded after one use.

(3) Food Service business means a full-service restaurant. limited-service restaurant,

2



O 0 ) Oy i Bl W R e

MMMMMMNMH!—‘HD—!MI—!D—II—!HI—!
“‘JO\U\-';UJM'—“D\DQO*JO‘\U\JLDJI\J'—'C)

28

CB-5-2015 (DR-2)

fast food restaurant. café. delicatessen. coffee shop. supermarket. grocery store. vending truck or
cart, food truck. business or institutional cafeteria, including those operated by or on behalf of
County departments and agencies. and other business selling or providing food within the
County for consumption on or off the premises.

(4) Polystyrene loose fill packaging means a void-filling packaging product

made of expanded polystyrene that is used as packaging fill. Polystyrene loose fill packaging is

commonly referred to as packing peanuts.
Sec. 19-140. Prohibition on sale or provision of expanded polystyrene food service
products and polystyrene loose fill packaging.

| (a) A food service business shall not sell or provide food in expanded

polystyrene food service products. regardless of where the food will be consumed.

(b) Subsection (a) shall not apply to prepackaged soup or other food that a food

service business sells or otherwise provides to its customers in expanded polystyrene containers

that have been filled and sealed prior to receipt by the food service business.

(c) Subsection (a) shall not apply to food or beverages that were filled and sealed in

expanded polystyrene containers outside of the County before a food service business received

them. or

(d) to materials used to package raw. uncooked or butchered meat. fish, poultry. or

seafood for off-premises consumption.

(e) A person shall not sell or offer for sale in the County polystyrene loose fill
packaging.
Sec. 19-141 Education and Outreach.

(@) The Department of Environment shall conduct an education and outreach campaien

before and during implementation of the provisions of this Act. This campaign should

include:
(1) Informational mailers to and direct contact with affected businesses: and
(2) Distribution of information through County internet and web-based resources: and
(3) News releases and news events,
Sec. 19-142. Prohibition on Sale.

(a) A person shall not sell or offer for sale in the County an expanded polystyrene food

service product.
















CB-005-2015(Draft 2) Page 3 of 3

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:




Lo R S T = T O, S U S T O R

[\.)[\._)n-l.—-n-—-b—ll—l»-—-n—l.—-r-—»l—l
= O 0 Ny B WO = o

DR-1

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-9-2015
Chapter No. 7
Proposed and Presented by  The Chairman (by request — County Executive
Introduced by Council Members Tumer, Lehman, Taveras, Franklin,
Davis, Patterson and Glaros
Date of Introduction April 21, 2015
BILL
AN ACT concerning

Subtitle 32 — Water Resources Protection and Grading Code

For the purpose of amending the provisions of the Rain Check Rebate Program, to reflect the
intent of CB-86-2014, by modifying the rebate amount for cisterns at residential properties and
clarifying language relating to rebates for green roofs.
BY repealing and reenacting with amendments:

SUBTITLE 32. WATER RESOURCES

PROTECTION AND GRADING CODE.

Section 32-201.03,

The Prince George's County Code

(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Section 32-201.03 of the Prince George's County Code be and the same is hereby
repealed and reenacted with the following amendments:

SUBTITLE 32. WATER RESOURCES PROTECTION AND GRADING CODE.

DIVISION 3. STORMWATER MANAGEMENT.
SUBDIVISION 4. STORMWATER MANAGEMENT RETROFIT PROGRAM.
Sec. 32-201.03. Rebates.

* * # * * * * * *

(G) The following techniques will be made available for rebates:



= e e T A W O, T N 'S B S

—_
o

CB-9-2015 (DR-1)

Technique

Residential

One or more techniques may

be installed for a lifetime
maximum rebate of $4,000

per property.

Commercial, Homeowner
Associations, Condominium
Associations, Civic Associations,
Multi-Family Dwelling, Non
Profits, Not-for-Profit
Organizations
One or more techniques may be
installed for a lifetime maximum

rebate of $20,000 per property.

gallons minimum

Urban Tree Canopy | $150/tree $150/tree

Rain Barrels $2/gallon stored $2/gallon stored (Must capture 100
(must capture 50 gallons) gallons)

Cisterns $[1]2/gallon stored, 250 $2/gallon stored, 250 gallons

minimum

Rain Garden

$10/square foot minimum
size 100 square feet

$10/square foot minimum size 100
square feet

Permeable Pavement | $12/square foot §$12/square foot 400 square foot
minimum
Pavement Removal | $6/square foot $6/square foot; 400 square foot

minimum

Green Roofs

$10/[sq.ft.] square foot;
minimum % roof retrofit

$10 [sq.ft.]/square foot — if less than
6" of planting material $20 [sq.
ft.]/square foot if over 6 of
planting material; minimum % roof
retrofit

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby

declared to be severable; and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,

sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of

competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining

words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this

Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such

invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, subparagraph, subsection,

or section.

SECTION 3. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.




CB-9-2015 (DR-1)

Adopted this _12" day of May , 2015.

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE |
GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

v ME

Mel Franklin
Chairman
ATTEST:
Redis C. Floyd
Clerk of the Council
APPROVED:

pate: 5 -79-701% BY:%Z—/Q(/%\

Rushern L. Baker, III
County Executive

KEY:

Underscoring indicates language added to existing law.

[Brackets] indicate language deleted from existing law.

Asterisks *** indicate intervening existing Code provisions that remain unchanged.












0 NN N W B W N e

CB-11-2015 (DR-1)

3719G Animal Care Attendant,
G-13 ($31.292 - $60.882)

3720G Animal Care Attendant Supervisor,
G-16 ($36.225 - $70.478)

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)
calendar days after it becomes law.
- Adopted this _12™ day of May _, 2015.

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE
GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

o ME

Mel Franklin
Chairman
ATTEST:
Redis C. Floyd
Clerk of the Council
APPROVED:

DATE: é/f Q—Zﬂ/f BY:’% L.,/QJ /)a\

Rushkern L. Baker, III
County Executive

KEY:

Underscoring indicates language added to existing law.

[Brackets] indicate language deleted from existing law.

Asterisks *** indicate intervening existing Code provisions that remain unchanged.













L= e < = U & N O P T T

-~ - S T o e S O L e N N e S
HO\DWQC\M&MMHQ\DWQU\U\#WMHO

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

SUBTITLE 32. WATER RESOURCES PROTECTION AND GRADING CODE.
DIVISION 1. ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS.
SUBDIVISION 2. GENERAL PROVISIONS.
Sec. 32-105. Administration; Permits; Expiration of Permits; Correction of Code
Violations and Suspension or Revocation and Reissuance of Permits.
(a) Any permit issued for grading pursuant to this Subtitle shall be issued only for a period

of time reasonably necessary to perform the work([, a period not to exceed 5 years], as defined in

Section 32-143. Where a permit is issued, extended. reissued, renewed or reinstated to correct a
violation, the permit shall not exceed ninety (90) days. The initial period of the permit shall be
established by the Director based upon the extent of the work required to correct the violation.

The permit may be extended or renewed beyond the ninety (90) days, only if the violations have

been corrected, [for an additional period of] in one-year increments if, in the opinion of the

Director, the applicant has demonstrated substantial progress to complete the work in accordance
with the permit and has demonstrated substantial justification for failure to complete the work
within the period of the permit. The Board of Appeals shall have no authority to grant an
extension to the period of the permit.
* #* * #* * #* . * * *®
(¢) A permit under which no work is commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days
after issuance shall expire and become null and void; provided, however, that the Director may

extend the time, as defined in Section 32-143, [not to exceed an additional one hundred eighty

(180) days] upon sufficient justification shown.

(d) A permit under which work has been started and later suspended or discontinued shall
expire and become null and void six (6) months after the work has stopped. Work will be
considered suspended when the permittee fails to prosecute the work so as to ensure completion
within a reasonable period of time.

* ® * * * * * * *

() When a permit has expired for failure to commence work, it may be extended,

renewed. reissued or reinstated within a period of [thirty (30) days from the date of expiration]

60 days prior to the permit expiration date, if the project conditions are in substantial compliance

with this subtitle and State law under which the permit was originally issued. A written request

and payment of required renewal or extension fees must be received sixty (60 days) prior to the




O 0 1] Yy W B W R e

e
o= O

14
13
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

31

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

permit expiration date. A fee shall be collected for each renewal. reissuance or reinstatement, as

further defined in Section 32-143. [; provided, however, that no permit shall be renewed more

than two (2) times.]
* * * * * # # * *

DIVISION 2. GRADING, DRAINAGE AND [POLLUTION CONTROL]
EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL.

Sec. 32-124. Purpose.

The purpose of this Division is to prevent property damage, protect living resources and
prevent environmental degradation to safeguard the public’s health, safety, welfare and
economic well-being by establishing minimum requirements for grading, reforestation,
woodland conservation, drainage, erosion control and pollution discharge and control on land
and to watercourses within Prince George’s County, Maryland, and to establish procedures by
which these requirements are to be administered and enforced. It is the further purpose of this
Division to implement the provisions of the [Environment Article-Title 4, Subtitle 1 of the
Annotated Code of Maryland, so as to safeguard the natural resources of the County and of the
State of Maryland by controlling erosion and sediment deposition on lands and in waters within

the watersheds of the State and to prevent their pollution.] Code of Maryland Regulations

(COMAR) 26.17.01. the 2011 Maryland Standards and Specifications (Standards and

Specifications) and the Stormwater Act of 2007 (Act). Implementing this Ordinance will help
reduce the negative impacts of land development on water resources. maintain the chemical,
physical. and biological integrity of streams. and minimize damage to public and private

property.
The provisions of this Ordinance pursuant to Title 4. Subtitle 1 of the Environment Article

of the Annotated Code of Maryland are adopted under the authority of the County Code and shall

apply to all land grading occurring within the County. The application of this Ordinance and the

provisions expressed herein shall be the minimum erosion and sediment control requirements

and shall not be deemed a limitation or repeal of any other powers granted by State statute,
See. 32-125. Definitions.

(a) Wherever the following words are used in, or in conjunction with, the administration of

this Division, they shall have the following meaning:

(1) Act. Maryland Stormwater Act of 2007.




O 0 -1 O U s L R e

MMMNMMMMMM'—‘P—‘D—‘}—'D—'I—MJ—‘HM
\DOO&]O‘\M-I:‘-WI\J'—‘D\DOOHJO\U\&WM'—‘C)

B

o

L

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(2) Administration. Maryland Department of the Environment (MDE) Water
Management Administration (WMA).

(3) Adverse impact. Any deleterious effect on waters or wetlands, including their

quality. quantity. surface area. species composition, aesthetics. or usefulness for human or

natural uses. which are or may potentially be harmful or injurious to human health. welfare,

safety or property. biological productivity. diversity, or stability or that unreasonably interfere

with the enjoyment of life or property. including outdoor recreation.

[(1)] (4) Afforestation. The establishment of a biological community of perpetual
woodlands either through the planting of trees in an area from which trees have always or very
long been absent, or planting of open areas which are not presently in forest cover.

[)] (8) Agricultural Land Management Practices. Those methods and
procedures used in the cultivation of land in order to further crop and livestock production and
conservation of related soil and water resources. Logging and/or timber harvesting operations
shall not be considered a part of this definition.

(6) Applicant. Any person, firm. or government agency that executes the necessary

forms to apply for a permit or approval to carry out construction of a project.

(7) Approval authority. The entity responsible for the review and approval of

erosion and sediment control plans is the Prince George’s Soil Conservation District.
[(3)] (8) ASTM. The American Society for Testing Materials.
[(4)] (9) Bedrock. The solid undisturbed rock in place either at the ground surface or

beneath surficial soil deposits.

(10) Best management practice (BMP). A structural device or nonstructural practice

designed to temporarily store or treat stormwater runoff in order to mitigate flooding. reduce

pollution. and provide other amenities.
[(5)] (11) Borrow Pit. The source of earth or bank-run sand and gravel from below

the ground surface by open pit excavation as a single incident on a site for use at a single
construction site elsewhere, otherwise, the excavation will be classed as open-pit mining.

[(6)] (12) Building Pad. The immediate site for a building including the area actually
covered, plus the adjacent peripheral fringe area having a reasonable slope away from the

building.






A = == T B O O D SO v T G T

p—t
—

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

Commission criteria. The Conservation Plan consists of an approved stormwater management
concept plan, an approved sediment and erosion control plan, a vegetation management plan, and
such other plans relating to environmental systems as may be required by the Washington
Suburban Sanitary Commission, the Maryland-National Capital Park and Planning Commission,
the Prince George’s County Health Department, the Department or the Prince George’s Soil
Conservation District.

[(15)] (23) Control Measures. Structural or nonstructural devices or practices, or a
combination thereof, which reduce pollutant discharges through control, treatment, prevention,
management or monitoring measures and processes.

(24) County. Prince George’s County Government.

[(16)] (25) Cultivation. Plowing, dicing, harrowing and tilling of existing farm fields
for the production of crops and livestock.

[(17)] (26) Department. Department of Permitting, Inspections, and Enforcement,

[(18)] (27) Director. The Director of the Department of Permitting, Inspections, and
Enforcement or the Director’s designee.

[(19)] (28) Discharge. Any dumping, pumping, placement, storage, use, draining,
handling, washing, tracking, spilling, leaking, transportation, conveyance or disposal practice or
any other mechanism which may result in or may allow pollutants to enter onto land or within
the watercourses of the County.

[(20)] (29) Drainage. Stormwater runoff, snow melt runoff, surface runoff or ground
water flows.

(30) Drainage area. That area contributing runoff to a single point measured in a

horizontal plane that is enclosed by a ridee line.

[(21)] (31) Drainage System. Any natural system or man-made device, mechanism or
measure used in any manner for the collection, conveyance, management, treatment, disposition
or disposal of drainage.

[(22)] (32) Dust Free Surface. A ground composed of rolled and compacted cinders,
gravels or other approved nonabsorbent materials to prevent rising of dust on roads, access ways,
driveways and parking lots.

[(23)] (33) Embankment of Fill. A deposit of soil, rock or other materials placed by

man.









co ~1 O b B W

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

[(38)] (56) One Hundred (100) Year Floodplain. That area which would be
inundated by a flood that has a one percent (1%) chance of being equaled or exceeded in any
given year.

[(39)] (537) Open-Pit Mining. The continuing or reoccurring removal of material from
below the ground surface by open excavation on a site for immediate or ultimate use at the same
or other site in processing and manufacturing of building and construction materials or any other

products, or at various locations elsewhere in its natural state.

(58) Owner/Developer. A person undertaking. or for whose benefit activities covered

by this Ordinance are carried on. General contractors or subcontractors, or both. without a

proprietary interest in a project are not included within this definition.

[(40)] (539) Permittee. Any person to whom a permit is issued pursuant to this
Division.

(60) Person. Includes the federal government. the State. any county, municipal

corporation, or other political subdivision of the State. or any of their units. or an individual,

receiver, trustee, guardian. executor. administrator. fiduciary. or representative of any kind, or

any partnership. firm. association, public or private corporation. or any of their affiliates. or any

other entity.
[(41)] (61) Pollutant. Sediment runoff due to erosion.

[(42)] (62) Ponding. Water that remains on the ground surface in a single area larger
than sixteen (16) square feet for more than forty-eight (48) hours after a rain event where cold
weather conditions (such as, but not limited to, frozen ground or combined ice, snow or rain
event) are not a contributing factor in water remaining on thé ground surface.

[(43)] (63) Prince George’s Soil Conservation District. One (1) of twenty four (24)
soil conservation districts created pursuant to Subtitle 3 of the Agricultural Article of the
Annotated Code of Maryland.

[(44)] (64) Professional Engineer. A person duly registered or otherwise authorized
by the State of Maryland to practice in the field of engineering.

[(45)] (65) Reforestation. The re-establishment of a biological community of
perpetual woodlands through the planting of trees on areas from which trees were recently

removed.
[(46)] (66) Refuse. See “solid wastes (refuse).”















N U U T O

o G0 01 O\t

10
11
12

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22

24
25
26
27
28
29

31

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

required to be implemented to prevent off-site sedimentation.

(f) Severability: If any portion. section, subsection. sentence, clause, or phrase of this

Ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent

jurisdiction. such portion shall be deemed a separate. distinct, and independent provision and

such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portion of this Ordinance, it being the

intent of the County that this Ordinance shall stand, notwithstanding the invalidity of any

portion. section, subsection. sentence, clause. or phrase. hereof.

(g) Penalties
(1) Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance is guilty of a

misdemeanor, and upon conviction in a court of competent jurisdiction is subject to a fine not

exceeding $10.000 or imprisonment not exceeding one vear or both for each violation with costs

imposed in the discretion of the court. Each day upon which the violation occurs constitutes a

separate offense.

(2) Any agency whose approval is required under this Ordinance or any interested

person may seek an injunction against any person who violates or threatens to violate any

provision of this Ordinance.

(3) Inaddition to any other sanction under this Ordinance. a person who fails to

install or to maintain erosion and sediment controls in accordance with an approved plan shall be

liable to County or the State in a civil action. for damages in an amount equal to double the cost

of installing or maintaining the controls.

(4) Any governing authority that recovers damages in accordance with this subsection

shall deposit them in a special fund. to be used solely for:

(A) Correcting to the extent possible the failure to implement or maintain

erosion and sediment controls: and

(B) Administration of the sediment control program.

32-142. [Changes to Plans] Modifications to Approved Erosion and Sediment Control

Plans.

[(a) All changes or modifications to the approved grading plans must be submitted to and
approved by the Director. All necessary substantiating reports shall be submitted with any
proposal to modify the approved grading plans. No grading or other work in connection with

any proposed modification shall be permitted without the prior written approval of the Director. ]

14






(=T I = (N ¥, T SO UU SR NG SR

MI\J[\J»—-M—"—A.—-J:—-—-;—-»—A.—-.—-
N'—‘CD\DGO*JO\M#MM.—-D\O

24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(b) Extension. Prior to the expiration of a grading permit, the permittee may present a
written request for an extension to the Director. If[, in the opinion of the Director] an extension
is warranted, [a one-time extension, not to exceed one (1) year may be granted] it may be granted

in one year increments, one year at a time. Extension fees shall be calculated at the same rate as

permit fees, and based on the amount of site area that has not received final inspection approval.

Extension fees for road construction included in a grading permit shall be calculated in

accordance with Section 23 of the County Code. The applicability of bonding requirements shall

be adjusted accordingly. Application for permit renewal and extension shall be made at least

sixty (60) days prior to the permit expiration date.

- (¢) Permit Expiration and Renewal. Application for permit renewal and extension shall be

made at least sixty (60) days prior to the permit expiration date.

(d) Extension bevond 6 vears. If. in the opinion of the Director. a permit extension beyond

six (6) vears is warranted. it may be granted in one vear increments. Such extensions require

Justification from the permittee and approval by the Director of the Department of Permitting,

Inspections and Enforcement.

(e) No Activity. If no site work and/or no site inspections have occurred in a six (6) month

period. the County may. in its sole discretion, default or close the permit.

Sec. 32-144. Inspection and Supervision.

(a) The Director or his desi gnee shall inspect all work and shall require that the permittee
furnish adequate supervision, documentation of satisfactory testing and compaction prepared and
certified by a professional engineer duly registered in the State of Maryland for all Class 1, Class
2 and Class 3 fills as deemed necessary.

(b) [Prior to the] After the issuance of a grading permit, the permittee, the contractor
and/or their agents shall attend a preconstruction meeting on-site with the Director or his

designee on each site requiring an approved sediment and erosion control plan.

#® # * * * * * * #

(e) The owner/developer shall maintain a copy of the approved erosion and sediment

control plan on site.

(f) Every active site having an approved erosion and sediment control plan should be

inspected for compliance with the plan on average. once every two (2) weeks.

(2) The County shall notify the on-site personnel or the owner/developer in writing when

16



o 1 O B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

31

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

violations are observed. describing:

(1) The nature of the violation:

(2) The required corrective action: and

(3) The time period in which to have the violation corrected.

(h) Right of Entry: It shall be a condition of every grading or building permit that the

County has the right to enter property periodically to inspect for compliance with the approved

plan and this Ordinance.

(1) Complaints: The County shall accept and investigate complaints regarding erosion and

sediment control concerns from any interested parties and:

(1) Conduct an initial investigation within three (3) working days from receipt of the

complaint:
2)

days from receipt of the complaint: and

the complainant of the initial investigation and findings within seven (7

(3) Take appropriate action when violations are discovered during the course of the

complaint investigation.

(4) For inspection and enforcement of the woodland conservation program and the erosion
and sediment control program, the following shall be required:
(1) Ensure that approved tree conservation plans and approved Erosion and Sediment
Control plans and permits are on the site and are complied with;
(2) Ensure that every active site having an erosion and sediment control plan is
inspected for compliance with the approved plan on the average of once every two weeks; and
(3) Prepare written reports after every inspection that describe:
(A) The date and location of this site inspection;
(B) Whether the approved plan has been properly implemented and maintained;
(C) Practical deficiencies or erosion and sediment control plan deficiencies; and
(D) If a violation exists, the type of enforcement action that is taken.

(E) If applicable. a description of any modifications to the plan.

Section 32-145. Reports.

* * # # * * * * %

(b) Prepare written reports after every inspection that describe:

(1) The date and location of this site inspection;

17



O 00 1 O W B W R e

MMMMMMMMD—‘I—‘I—.I—IS—‘HI—JI—!HH
‘JO\U\J‘;‘-WMHQKDOOH]O\U\-BWN'—‘D

28

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(2) Whether the approved plan has been properly implemented and maintained:

(3) Practical deficiencies or erosion and sediment control plan deficiencies:

(4) Ifaviolation exists. the type of enforcement action that is taken; and

(3) Ifapplicable, a description of any modifications to the plan.

* * * * * * * * *

Sec. 32-152. Ground Stabilization.

(a) All graded surfaces shall have suitable soil for permanent vegetative growth; free of
any rocks, stones or other nonirreducible/nonorganic matter larger than one and one-half (1%)
inches in diameter; [diced] disked and raked; and shall be limed, fertilized, seeded, mulched with
tack or sodded, planted or otherwise protected from erosion; and shall be watered, tended and
maintained until growth is well established.

(1) Topsoil shall be in accordance with the Maryland Department of the
Environment, Standards and Specifications for Soil Erosion and Sediment Control, [21.0] B-4-2
Standard and Specifications for [Topsoil,] Topsoiling and soil amendments or approved
subsequent revisions thereof.

(2) Stabilization methods and materials shall be in accordance with the Maryland
Department of the Environment, Standards and Specifications for Erosion and Sediment Control,

[20.0] B-4-4, B-4-5, Standards and Specifications for [Vegetative Stabilization] Temporary and

Permanent Stabilization, or approved subsequent revisions thereof.

* * ® % * * * * *

Sec. 32-153. Contents, Review and Approval of the Erosion and Sediment Control Plan.

* * * * * * #® * *

- (b) At aminimum. [A]applicants shall submit the following information to the Prince

George’s Soil Conservation District:

(1) A letter of transmittal and/or application known as a site analysis;

(2) A vicinity sketch indicating north arrow, scale and other information necessary to
easily locate the property;
[(3) A plan at an appropriate scale indicating at least:]
[(A) Name, address and telephone number of’]
[(1) The owner of the property where the grading is proposed;]
[(aa) The applicant;]

18






A - R B = U U T U U T (6 T

e S I A B N L e o O G L L L e T N T e T S —
fan] o co | (=)} wn 4= L] g ] —_ o o [=o] ~J (2% wh EEN L8] 2 — s

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(iii) The developer.
(B) The existing topography and improvements as well as proposed topography

and improvements at a scale between 1” = 10’ and 17 = 50’ with 2 foot contours or other
approved contour interval;
(C) Scale, project and sheet title. and north arrow on each plan sheet:
(D) The proposed grading and earth disturbance including:
(1) Total disturbed area;
(i) Volume of cut and fill quantities:

(iii) Volume of borrow and spoil guantities:

(iv) Specific limits of disturbance consistent to that shown on an approved

Tvpe 2 Tree Conservation Plan: and

(v) A clear and definite delineation of all woodland conservation areas and

areas to remain undisturbed consistent with the approved Type 2 Tree Conservation Plan:

(E) Scale. project and sheet title. and north arrow on each plan sheet:
(F) The limit of disturbance (LOD) including:

(1) Limit of grading (grading units, if applicable): and

(i) Initial. interim, and final phases:
(G) Storm drainage features. including:

(1) Existing and proposed bridges. storm drains, culverts. outfalls, etc:

(i) Velocities and quantities of peak flow rates at outfalls for the two-year

and ten-vear frequency storm events: and

(ii1) Site conditions around points of all surface water discharge from the

site;
(H) Erosion and sediment control practices to minimize on-site erosion and
prevent off-site sedimentation including:

(1) The salvage and reuse of top soil;

(i) Phased construction and implementation of grading unit(s) to minimize

disturbances. both in extent and duration. not to exceed 20 acres:

(iii) Location and tvpe of all proposed erosion and sediment control

practices:

20



R o T = L R U o S

—
o o= O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(iv) Design details and data for all erosion and sediment control practices:

and

(v) Specifications for temporary and permanent stabilization measures

including. at a minimum:

a. The “Standard Stabilization Note” on the plan stating: “Following

initial soil disturbance or re-disturbance. permanent or temporary stabilization must be

completed within:

1. Three (3) calendar days as to the surface of all perimeter

dikes. swales. ditches. perimeter slopes. and all slopes steeper than 3 horizontal to 1 vertical

3:1):; and

2. Seven (7) calendar days as to all other disturbed or graded

areas on the project site not under active grading.”

b. Details for areas requiring accelerated stabilization: and

¢. Maintenance requirements as defined in the Standards and

Specifications;
[(4)] (8) Design details for structural controls;

[(5)](9) Details of temporary and permanent stabilization measures including

placement of the statement on the plan that following initial soil disturbance or redisturbance,
permanent or temporary stabilization shall be completed within seven (7) calendar days for the
surface of all perimeter dikes, swales, ditches, perimeter slopes and all slopes greater than 3
horizontal to 1 vertical (3:1), and for all embankments of ponds, basins and traps; and fourteen
(14) days for all other disturbed or graded areas on the project site provided that the requirements
of this Section do not apply to those areas which are shown on the plan and are currently being
used for material storage or for those areas on which actual construction activities are currently
being performed or to interior areas of a surface mine site where the stabilization material would
contaminate the recoverable resource;

[(6)] (10) A [S]sequence of construction describing the relationship between the
implementation and maintenance of controls, including permanent and temporary stabilization
and the various stages or phases of earth disturbance and construction. Any changes or revisions

to the sequence of construction must be approved by Prince George’s Soil Conservation District

21









E VS T O R

O 00 -3 Oy wLh

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19

2l
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

Division, the State Sediment Control Regulations, COMAR 26.17.01, the Standards and
Specifications, or the preservation of public health and safety.

(c) Review and Approval of Erosion and Sediment Control Plans

(1) A person may not grade land without an erosion and sediment control plan

approved by the Prince George’s Soil Conservation District if the site is not exempt from these

requirements.

(2) The Prince George’s Soil Conservation District shall review erosion and sediment

control plans to determine compliance with this Ordinance and the Standards and Specifications

prior to approval. In approving the plan. the Prince George’s Soil Conservation District may

impose such conditions that may be deemed necessary to ensure compliance with the provisions
of this Ordinance. COMAR 26.17.01. the Standards and Specifications. and the preservation of
public health and safety.

(3) The review and approval process shall be in accordance with the comprehensive

and integrated plan approval process described in the Standards and Specifications. Prince

George’s County Stormwater Ordinance. and the Act.

(4) Ataminimum. a concept plan must include the mapping of natural resources and

sensitive areas including highly erodible soils and slopes greater than 15 percent as well as

information required under Prince George’s County Stormwater Ordinance. These areas are to

remain undisturbed or an explanation must be included with either the concept or site

development plan describing enhanced protection strategies for these areas during construction.

Approved concept sediment control plans remain valid for three (3) vears from the date of

approval unless extended or renewed by the Prince George’s Soil Conservation District.

(5) A site development plan submittal must include all concept plan information and

indicate how proposed erosion and sediment control practices will be integrated with proposed

stormwater management practices. The latter is being done through a narrative and an overlay

plan showing both ESD and erosion and sediment control practices. An initial sequence of

construction and proposed project phasing to achieve the grading unit restriction should be

submitted at this time. Approved site development sediment control plans remain valid for three

(3) vears from the date of approval unless extended or renewed by the Prince Georee’s Soil

Conservation District.

24






L0 N N W s W R e

(95 ] (V'S ] [ (R 2 ) [ o] 3] [ \.] [ o] ] — — — A pozeiry —t — — - —
== ~ R S = AV SO S e T e e B = S T S 5 T G R e

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(2) A standard erosion and sediment control plan must meet the requirements of this

Ordinance and the Standards and Specifications.
(3) MDE shall review and approve a standard plan prior to its adoption.

DIVISION 3. STORMWATER MANAGEMENT.
SUBDIVISION 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS.
Sec. 32-170. Short Title; Purpose.

* * * #* * *® * * *

(f) The following referenced documents are necessary to provide appropriate technical
guidance for the planning, design, construction, inspection and enforcement of the provisions of
this Division. These documents are revised periodically and it is incumbent upon property
owners, planners, designers and applicants to use the most current approved versions available.
For purposes of this Division, the following documents are hereby adopted and incorporated by
reference:

(1) The 2000 Maryland Stormwater Management Design Manual, Volumes I and II
Maryland Department of the Environment (April 2000), as amended; and

(2) The current edition of the 2014 Prince George’s County Stormwater Management

Design Manual or any subsequent revisions: and
| [(2)I(3) The USDA Natural Resources Conservation Service Maryland Conservation
Practice Standard Pond Code 378 (January 2000), as amended.
[(3)1(4) Adopted Comprehensive Watershed Management Plans:
(A) CR-61-1986 — Piscataway Creek
_ (B) CR-62-1986 — Henson Creek
Sec. 32-171. Definitions.

(a) For purposes of this Division, the following terms, phrases and words, and their

derivations shall have the meaning given herein:
* % * *® ® * * # %
(5) Alternative Practice. An environmental site design practice or technique or
structural stormwater management measure that is not found in the Maryland Design Manual and
is proposed during concept plan approval. Alternative practices shall be designed to meet the
criteria in the Maryland Design Manual, meet the minimum requirements specified in Section

32-178 of this Division and be approved by the Administration.

26






S = T . T N U R

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

[(55)] (56) Redevelopment. Any construction, alteration or improvement performed
on sites where existing land use is commercial, industrial, institutional, or multifamily residential
and existing site impervious area within the limit of disturbance exceeds 40 percent.

[(56)] (57) Retention Structure. A permanent structure that provides for the storage
of runoff and is designed to maintain a permanent pool of water.

[(37)] (38) Retrofitting. The implementation of ESD practices, the construction of
structural BMP, or the modification of an existing structural BMP in a previously developed area
to improve water quality over current conditions.

[(58)] (59) Sediment. Soils or other surficial materials transported or deposited by the
action of wind, water, snow, ice or gravity as a product of erosion.

[(59)] (60) Site. For new development, any tract, lot, or parcel of land or combination
of tracts, lots, parcels of land that are in one ownership or are contiguous and in diverse
ownership, where development is to be performed as a part of a unit, subdivision or project.

[(60)] (61) Site Development Plan. The second of three required plan approvals that
includes the information necessary to allow a detailed evaluation of a proposed project.

[(61)] (62) Stabilization. The prevention of soil movement by any of various
vegetative and/or structural means.

[(62)] (63) Stormwater. Water that originates from a precipitation event.

[(63)] (64) Stormwater Management (SWM). Using ESD for the collection,
conveyance, storage, treatment and disposal of stormwater runoff in a manner to prevent
accelerated channel erosion, increased flood damage and/or degradation of water quality.

[(64)] (65) Stormwater Management Design Plan. The set of drawings and other
documents that comprise all of the information and specifications for the systems, structures,
concepts, and techniques that will be used to control stormwater as required by the approved
concept plan and the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Desien Manual.

[(65)] (66) Stormwater Management System. Natural areas, ESD practices,

stormwater management measures, and any other structures through which stormwater flows,
infiltrates or discharges from a site.

[(66)] (67) Stormwater Variance. The modification of the minimum stormwater
management requirements for specific circumstances such that strict adherence to the

requirements would result in unnecessary hardship and not fulfill the intent of this Division.

28









[N ]

[ T o R o N S o o e | — b b b et b ek ek e e
[, wn e ('S (o] — o O [+ ~1 (@) wn RN 3 2 —_ ] o o ~] (=% h 4 L

2
~]

28

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

(a) The minimum control requirements established in this Section and the Maryland

Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual are as follows:™ -

(1) Planning techniques, nonstructural practices, and design methods specified in the

Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual shall be used to

implement ESD to the MEP. The use of ESD planning techniques and treatment practices must
be exhausted before any structural BMP is implemented. Stormwater management design plans
for development projects subject to this Division shall be designed using ESD sizing criteria,
recharge volume, water quality volume, and channel protection storage volume criteria according

to the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual. The MEP

standard is met when channel stability is maintained, 100% predevelopment groundwater
recharge is replicated, non-point source pollution is minimized, and structural stormwater
management practices are used only if determined to be absolutely necessary.

(2) Attenuation of the 2-year, 10-year frequency storm event for downstream erosion

exist and/or attenuation of the 100-year frequency storm event for downstream flooding exist are

required according to the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design
Manual and all subsequent revisions when the Department determines that additional stormwater
management is necessary because the receiving channel and/or conveyance system are
determined inadequate.

* # * # % * * * *
Sec. 32-179. Stormwater Management Measures.

The ESD planning techniques, practices and structural stormwater management measures in

this Division and the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual
shall be used either alone or in combination in a stormwater management design plan. An
applicant shall demonstrate that ESD has been implemented to the MEP before the use of a
structural BMP is considered in developing the stormwater management design plan.
(a) ESD Planning Techniques and Practices.
(1) The following planning techniques shall be applied to MEP according to the
Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual to satisfy the

applicable minimum control requirements established in 32-178 of this Division:

* * * #* * * * * o

(2) The following ESD treatment practices shall be designed to MEP according to the

3



Rl = O O O VT T S

wwNNMMNMMMMMD—‘i—‘HI—‘HHI—GHHH
-—ac::uocaoqc\m-hmm»—-o\ooouoxu..pmw»—o

CB-36-2015 (DR-1)

Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Desien Manual to satisfy the

applicable minimum control requirements established in 32-178 of this Division:
* * % * * % % % *
(3) The use of ESD planning techniques and treatment practices specified in this
Section shall not conflict with existing state law or local ordinances, regulations, or policies. The
County shall modify planning and zoning ordinances and public works codes to eliminate any
impediments to implementing ESD to the MEP according to the Maryland Design Manual and

the Prince George’s County Design Manual.

(b) Structural Stormwater Management Measures.
(1) The following structural stormwater management practices shall be designed

according to the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual to

satisfy the applicable minimum control requirements established in 32-178 of this Division:

* * * * * * * #* #

(2) The performance criteria specified in the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince

George’s County Design Manual with re gard to general feasibility, conveyance, pretreatment,

treatment and geometry, environment and landscaping, and maintenance shall be considered
when selecting structural stormwater management practices.
* ¥ * * % * * * %
(d) Altemnative ESD planning techniques, treatment practices and structural stormwater
measures may be used for new development runoff control if they meet the performance criteria

established in the Maryland Design Manual and the Prince George’s County Design Manual and

all subsequent revisions and are approved by the Administration. Practices used for
redevelopment projects shall be approved by the Department.

* % * * * * * * #
Sec. 32-180. Specific Design Criteria.

The basic design criteria, methodologies, and construction specifications, subject to the
approval of the Department and the Administration, shall be in accordance with the Maryland

Design Manual and the Prince Georgé’s County Design Manual.

* # * * # * * * *

Sec. 32-182. Stormwater Management Design Plans, Submission Requirements.

(a) Concept Plan.

32





















L T S S S

CB-13-2015 (DR-2)

(19) Within ten feet of a curb-side residential mailbox. except Sundays and Federal

holidays. subject to a complaint by the property owner

* * * * % % * * *

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)
calendar days after it becomes law.

Adopted this 14™ day of July , 2015.

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE
GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

M=

BY:
Mel Franklin
Chairman
ATTEST:
Redis C. Floyd ’
Clerk of the Council
APPROVED:

DATE: 7/’//? //'/ﬂ/é/ BY:% l—/"@’(/ja\

Rushern L. Baker, III
County Executive

KEY:

Underscoring indicates language added to existing law.

[Brackets] indicate language deleted from existing law.

Asterisks *** indicate intervening existing Code provisions that remain unchanged.




























































O 00 1 N s W e

e e
o= O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
2
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

CB-41-2015 (DR-4)

Sec. 12-114. Food Service Manager Certification.

* * * * * * * * *

(k) Application for a food service manager certificate must be made to the Department by
submitting the following:
(1) A completed application along with a [Thirty-five Dollar ($35.00)] fee as

prescribed in the Table of Fees, and a recent photograph clearly showing the applicant's facial

features when trimmed to a size of 2 inches by 2 inches; and

* * * * * #* * * #

(m) Renewal certificates will be issued upon receipt of the following:

(1) A complete application along with the [Thirty-five Dollar (§35.00)] fee as

prescribed in the Table of Fees; and
. * * * * * * * # #*
(o) The fee for the replacement of a food service manager certificate is [Fifteen Dollars

($15.00)] prescribed in the Table of Fees.
DIVISION 6. VENDING MACHINES.

Sec. 12-166. Permit fee.
(a) For every vending machine location permit issued, a fee [of One Hundred Twenty-Five

Dollars ($125.00)] as prescribed in the Table of Fees shall be paid before the issuance of any

permit.
(b) A duplicate permit will be issued, on request, at a charge [of Fifteen Dollars ($15.00)]

as prescribed in the Table of Fees.

# * # * * # * * &

SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.
DIVISION 4. RENTAL HOUSING.
Sec. 13-189. Schedule of fees; refunds; review of fees.

(a) At the time of application for the initial license or for license renewal, [the Director
shall collect] a license and inspection fee [of Fifty Dollars ($50.00)] for a multifamily rental
facility for each dwelling unit, and [Seventy-five Dollars ($75.00) for] a single-family rental
facility for each dwelling unit shall be collected per the fee prescribed in the Table of Fees. The

license shall be for a two (2) year period.

* * * #* # * * * #

13










































CB-41-2015 (DR-4)

Retaining Wall $90 $50+ construction cost *
0.008 + Grading Fee
Retaining Wall > 2 ft. $150 $50+ construction cost *
0.008 + Grading Fee
Roofing (covering) $150 $50+ construction cost *
5 0.008
Roofing (Shingles & Plywood) $90 $50+ construction cost *
: 0.008
Shed > 150 sq. ft. $90 $50+construction cost *
0.008 + Grading Fee
Signs, Freestanding $200 $50+construction cost *
0.008 + Grading Fee
Solar Panels (Ground-mounted) $100 + $50+construction cost *
Grading Fee | 0.008 + Grading Fee
Solar Panels (Ground-mounted/Pole) $200+ $50+construction cost *
Grading Fee | 0.008 + Grading Fee
Solar Panels (Roof-mounted) - Residential $100 $50+ construction cost *
0.008
Solar Panels (Roof-mounted) - Commercial $200 $50+ construction cost *

0.008

Special Event

$150 ( first 10

$20 for each additional

Structures) structure
Sun Room $150 $50+construction cost *
0.008 + Grading Fee
Swimming Pool - Commercial $375 $50+ Grading Fee if in-
ground
Swimming Pool (Above-ground) - Residential $100 -
Swimming Pool (In-ground) - Residential $225 $225 + Grading Fee
Tanks (above ground) $125 $50+ construction cost *
0.008+ Grading Fee
Tanks (below ground) $125 $50+ construction cost *
0.008+ Grading Fee
Tanks ( removal ) $130 $50-+construction cost*
0.008+Grading Fee
Telecommunication Antennas ( Modification ) $225 -
Telecommunication Antennas ( Co-location ) $375 -
Telecommunication Antennas (new) $750 $50+ construction cost *
0.008+ Grading Fee
Television & Radio Equipment Repair Facility $75 -

&1


































Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

Meeting Date: 9/9/2015

Reference No.: CB-046-2015

Draft No.: 1

Proposer(s): County Executive

Sponsor(s): Franklin, Toles, Lehman, Harrison, Davis, Taveras

Item Title: An Act for the purpose of amending the Prince George’s County Fire Safety Code to adopt
the standards of the National Fire Protection Association regarding increasing administrative
fees for apartment buildings related to fire safety

Drafter: Mary Blocker, Fire/EMS Department

Resource Personnel: Benjamin Barksdale,Fire/EMS Department

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented: 7/7/2015 Executive Action: 9/22/2015 S
Committee Referral: 7/7/2015 - PSFM Effective Date: 11/9/2015
Committee Action: 7/16/2015 - FAV

Date Introduced: 7/21/2015

Public Hearing: 9/9/2015 - 1:30 AM

Council Action (1) 9/9/2015 - ENACTED

Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:A, DT:A, KT:A, TT:A

Pass/Fail: P

Remarks:

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS:
11-163

COMMITTEE REPORTS:
Public Safetv and Fiscal Management Date 7/16/2015

REPORT: Committee Vote: Favorable, 5-0 (In favor: Council Members Patterson, Harrison, Lehman ,Taveras, and
Turmer)

CB-46-2015 seeks to amend the Prince George’s County Fire Safety Code by changing the method for calculations of
fire inspection fees for apartment buildings. The fee will change from $120.00 per building and $2.50 per apartment
inspected, to an hourly rate of $125.00. The fee only applies to Office of the Fire Marshall personnel who conduct
fire inspections and will cover travel, report writing, research and witnessing tests.

The Office of Audits and Investigations finds that the enactment of CB-46-2015 should not have an adverse fiscal
impact on the County. FIRE/EMS personnel estimate that the fees collected will cover the cost of personnel
conducting the inspections as well as any needed tools, supplies and equipment.

The Office of Law has reviewed this legislation and finds it to be in proper legislative form with no legal












e S T o N L T O L o o i N o G R T T S S S G
C:J\OOOHJG\U\-BWN'—‘C)\DGOHJO\U‘I-P-WM'—‘CD\OQO‘-JO\U‘I-P-WI\JH

CB-16-2015 (DR-3)

(2) A letter of support from the municipality for the Food Truck Hub. if the property

to be occupied by the Food Truck Hub is located within the corporate boundaries of a

municipality, or if not in a municipality. a letter of support from the Prince George’s County

Economic Development Corporation.

(3) Permission of the property owner where the Food Truck Hub will be located with

a copy of the existing site plan. If the Food Truck Hub is located on the public right-of-way. a

letter of permission is also required from the municipality, the County. or the State that is the

record property owner of the right-of-way:.

4) Schedule of specific operational days and hours to begin no earlier than 6:00 a.m.

and end no later than 9:00 p.m.

(5) The number of mobile units on a given day,

Section 5-189-04. Duties and Responsibilities of a Coordinator.
(a) A Coordinator shall:

(1) Compile and provide to the Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement

for enforcement purposes per Subtitle a comprehensive list of licensed vendors that comprise a

specific Food Truck Hub to include each participating vendor’s Tax Identification Number.

County license. Health Department certification and demonstrated proof that a participating

vendor has no outstanding notice of violations.

(2) Report a change in vendor participation to the Department of Permitting, Inspections

and Enforcement through written communication within 24 hours before or after of such change.

and include each new participating vendor’s Tax Identification Number. County license. Health

Department certification and demonstrated proof that said vendor has no outstanding violations.

(3) Report an unlicensed vendor to the Department of Permitting, Inspections and

Enforcement for appropriate enforcement action per Subtitle.

(4) Ensure that only vendors included on the Food Truck Hub participating Vendors® List

submitted to the Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement are on-site selling

products.
(5) Ensure that the Food Truck Hub remains free of trash by providing adequate trash

receptacles. including recycling receptacles. and that said receptacles are emptied on a dailv

basis to prevent trash build-up. rodent infestation and other health-related concerns.







O 0 3 O Lh B R e

e e R R i e T T ey
0 N N Rk W N = O

CB-16-2015 (DR-3)

(b) Notwithstanding any other provision of this Division, it shall be unlawful for any
hawker, peddler, roadside vendor, huckster, itinerant vendor, or any other person to sell, attempt
to sell, or display for sale any goods, wares, merchandise, or other items of any description while
upon the right-of-way, or from a vehicle upon the right-of-way except for the following:

* #* * * #* # # # *

(11) Mobile units that are authorized as participants of a designated Food Truck Hub
as defined by Section 5-189.01.

* * # # * * * # *

SECTION 3. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act will limit the number of Food
Truck Hub licenses to twelve (12) for the first year of implementation, which can be revisited
after one-year of operation to determine if additional Food Truck Hub venues need to be added
within the County per recommendation of the Food Truck Hub Oversi ght Committee to the
County Council. Three of the licenses are reserved for locations near metro stations at Naylor
Road, Suitland, and New Carrollton to ensure that food truck hubs occur throughout the County.
Licenses shall not be allocated within one quarter mile of the entrance of metro stations at Largo
Town Center, Prince George’s Plaza, Branch Avenue, and West Hyattsville.

SECTION 4. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.






Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

Meeting Date: 10/6/2015

Reference No.: CB-016-2015

Draft No.: 3

Proposer(s): Glaros, Lehman, Toles

Sponsor(s): Glaros, Lehman, Toles, Davis

Item Title: An Act providing certain limited exemptions to County licensing and health requirements for
Food Truck Hubs, in order to encourage economic development, increase public access to
healthy food options, minimize or eliminate food deserts in underserved areas of the County,
and promote innovative entrepreneurship and revitalization in furtherance of the public safety,
health, and welfare of the citizens and residents of Prince George’s County.

Drafter: Leroy D. Maddox, Jr., Legislative Officer

Resource Personnel;

Aimee Olivo,Legislative Aide District 3
Bridget Warren,Legislative Aide District 1
Dwayne M. Mingo,Legislative Aide District 7

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented:
Committee Referral:

Committee Action:

Date Introduced:
Public Hearing:

Council Action (1)
Council Votes:
Pass/Fail:
Remarks:

4/21/2015 Executive Action: 10/15/2015 S
4/21/2015 - HEHS Effective Date: 11/30/2015

6/11/2015 - HELD
7/20/2015 - FAV(A)

7/21/2015
10/6/2015 - 1:30 PM

10/6/2015 - ENACTED
DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:A, DT:N, KT:A, TT:A
P

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS:
05-189.01, 05-189.02, 05-189.03, 05-189.04, 05-190, 05-193.01

COMMITTEE REPORTS:
HEALTH. EDUCATION & HUMAN SERVICES Date 7/20/2015










































A~ W

R e e = N v

CB-51-2015 (DR-2)

Section 5-2802 of the County Code are required to have a Certified Food Manager

Certificate pursuant to Section 12-114. The certificate holder shall be present at all

times of operation. Vendors at mobile farmer’s markets selling unprepared foods such

as whole and uncut fruits and vegetables are not covered by this section.

(c) All mobile vendors and special food services facilities — mobile units as defined by

Section 5-2802 of the County Code are required to pass an inspection by the Health

Department pursuant to Section 12-112.
Sec. 5-2808. Approval/Denial of License.

(a) The special food service facility — mobile unit license application of any applicant shall

be approved or denied by the Department of Permitting. Inspections. and Enforcement within

thirty (30) business days of the date the application is filed with the Department of Permitting,
Inspections, and Enforcement. The Department of Permitting. Inspections. and Enforcement

shall deny a special food service facility — mobile unit license if*

(1)_The applicant has made a false statement upon the application or has given false

information in connection with an application: or

(2) The applicant has not provided all documentation certification required by the

Department of Permitting. Inspections. and Enforcement.

(3)_The applicant or a director, officer. partner or principal of the applicant has had a

special food service facility — mobile unit license revoked or suspended anywhere within the

state within one year prior of the application, convicted for vending without a special food

service facility — mobile unit license. or convicted for a criminal offense committed while

vending with a special food service facility — mobile unit license: or

(4)__A corporate applicant is not in good standing or authorized to do business in the

State: or

(5) The applicant is overdue in the payment of County taxes, fees. fines or penalties

assessed against him/her or imposed against him/her in relation to a special food service facility

— mobile unit.

(b) In the event that the Department of Permitting. Inspections. and Enforcement

denies a special food service facility — mobile unit license application. the Department of

Permitting. Inspections. and Enforcement shall. in writing. state the reasons for the denial. and a

copy of such decision shall be sent to the applicant by first class mail to the address provided by

























B S L

O 00 ~1 Oy W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
2015 Legislative Session

DR-2

Bill No. CB-30-2015
Chapter No. 39
Proposed and Presented by Council Member Franklin
Introduced by Council Members Franklin, Lehman and Taveras
Co-Sponsors
Date of Introduction September 29, 2015
BILL
AN ACT concerning

County-based Business Compliance

For the purpose of establishing an annual Local Business Participation Procurement Report,

requiring the report to be annually provided to the County Council and County Executive, and

generally relating to County-based business assistance.

BY adding:

SUBTITLE 10A. PURCHASING.
Section 10A-176,

The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,

DIVISION 7. ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

SUBDIVISION 4. LOCAL BUSINESS PARTICIPATION PROCUREMENT REPORT.

See. 10A-176. Annual Local Business Participation Procurement Report Required.

Maryland, that Section 10A-176 of the Prince George's County Code be and the same is hereby
added:

Within ninety (90) days after the end of each fiscal vear. the Director of Central Services

shall prepare and transmit a written report. the Local Business Participation Procurement Report,

to the County Council and County Executive that includes the following information for that

entire fiscal vear:








































o0 N Oy L R W e

| I S B e e e T o T T TS S Y
O D 0 N DY W s W N = O

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-59-2015

DR-3

Chapter No. 46

Proposed and Presented by ~ Council Members Taveras and Turner

Introduced by Council Members Taveras, Tumer, Lehman and Harrison

Co-Sponsors

Date of Introduction October 6, 2015

BILL

AN ACT concerning
Age Restricted Senior Rental Leases

For the purpose of amending the Landlord-Tenant Code to provide certain age restricted senior

lessees with twenty-four month residential leases; to provide for the administration and notice of

the Program; and generally relating to senior rental leases in age restricted senior housing in the

County.

BY repealing and reenacting with amendments:

SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.

Sections 13-138 and 13-161,
The Prince George's County Code

(2011 Edition, 2014 Supplement).
BY adding:

SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.

Sections 13-165, 13-166, and 13-167,
The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition, 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,

Maryland, that Sections 13-138 and 13-161 of the Prince George's County Code be and the same

are hereby repealed and reenacted with amendments:
SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.
DIVISION 3. LANDLORD-TENANT REGULATIONS.



o0 1 N U B LB

== S N R o L O L N N o T e
ﬁD\DWﬂO\WhWNMO\DWH}O\MLMMHD

CB-59-2015 (DR-3)

SUBDIVISION 2. LANDLORD-TENANT CODE.
Sec. 13-138. Definitions.
-(a) For the purposes of this Division (and Division 4), the following terms have the

meanings:
(1.1) Age restricted senior housing means any senior facility and/or building that has

an age restriction of fifty-five (55) vears and older for a lease to live in the facility and/or

building.
* * * * * * ® * *
(13) Senior lessee means a person at least fifty-five (55) vears of age at the time the

lease or renewal is offered.

* _ # * * * * * * *

Sec. 13-161. Lease agreement; conditions.
~ (a) As a condition precedent to the leasing of a dwelling unit in a multifamily and in age

restricted senior housing in this County, there shall be either an oral lease between the landlord

and tenant, where such an oral lease is allowable under Maryland law, or a written lease
evidencing the understanding of the parties which shall be executed by both the landlord and the
tenant.
(b) The lease shall be subject to the following conditions:
(1) If the lease is in writing, it shall be executed in duplicate, one (1) copy of which
shall be provided to the tenant at the time of execution.
(2) The lease shall be for an initial term as shall be specified and renewable for such

additional term, if any, as shall be specified. except as provided under Section 13-166. Such

renewing shall be at the tenant's option. All terms and conditions of renewals shall be the same

as for the initial term, except as provided under Section 13-166 or as may be otherwise agreed to

by the parties, and except for lawful rent increases.
* * * * * * * * *
SECTION 2. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Sections 13-165, 13-166, and 13-167 of the Prince George's County Code be and
the same are hereby added:
SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.
DIVISION 3. LANDLORD-TENANT REGULATIONS.



R I = R = T S U e N

) (8%} o] 2 2 [ S N ] [N e ] [y I~ | [ — — —_ — fo—— —
Lol e o L« L e T = L O S S == T "= S -~ T B o S ;SR SUR 'S TR O S,

CB-59-2015 (DR-3)

SUBDIVISION 2. LANDLORD-TENANT CODE.

Sec. 13-165. Senior rental leases; authority and purpose.

The purpose of this section is to protect the tenancies of certain County households and

residents in the rental housing market. The County Council finds that senior lessees. particularly

those on limited or fixed incomes. can experience hardships in maintaining rental housing
accommodations and that it is in the best interest of public health. safety and welfare to regulate

the leasing of rental housing for seniors in the County.

Sec. 13-166. Senior rental leases, offered.

(a) On or after June 1. 2016. a landlord shall offer an initial lease or. when a current

lease expires. a renewal lease, with a lease term of at least twenty-four (24) months to a senior

lessee residing in age-restricted senior housing. unless the senior lessee agrees otherwise. Rental

housing not covered in this Act includes. but is not limited to. assisted living. care home. and

nursing home facilities. The twenty-four (24) month lease or renewal lease shall apply to senior

lessees in a facility that are at least fifty five (55) vears of age at the time the lease or renewal is

offered.

(b) The initial or renewal lease offered under subsection (a) above shall also comply with

Sections 13-161. 13-162 and 13-163 of this subdivision.

(¢) The term of new or renewal senior leases shall be for twenty four (24) months and

shall remain without fee or rent increases for the entire period.

(d) Landlords are required to provide written notice to all lessees about the twenty-four

month period upon entering into a new lease or a renewal lease. The landlord must keep a record

of seniors who are using the twenty-four (24) month lease period. Any senior who waives the

twenty-four (24) month lease period needs to complete a waiver form. or have the waiver

indicated on the lease. which the landlord must keep on file for three years.

Sec. 13-167. Administration. Notice.
(a) The Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement: shall. as part of the

biennial license renewal process:

(1) provide landlords with written notice that a twenty-four (24) month requirement

is in effect in their new or renewal licenses. and

(2) provide landlords with written notice of this Act within 30 calendar days after its

effective date.



O 0 1 O L B W —

p— ek
N o= O

14
15
16
17

CB-59-2015 (DR-3)

(b) The Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement shall use the rental
license process to determine if landlords have appropriately offered the twenty-four (24) month
lease period to lessees. The Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement may deny.
suspend or revoke a rental license or the renewal of a rental license. pursuant to Sections 13-184
or 13-187 of the Code. if they find that the landlord has not offered this lease period.

(¢) The Department of Housing and Community Development. in conjunction with the
Department of Social Services and the Office on Aging. will use HUD and other housing

resources to help encourage financial literacy and to provide housing information to seniors.
SECTION 3. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby

declared to be severable; and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,

sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining
words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this
Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, subparagraph, subsection, or section.
SECTION 4. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.






Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

11/3/2015

Meeting Date:

Reference No.: CB-059-2015

Draft No.: 3

Proposer(s): Taveras, Turner

Sponsor(s): Taveras, Turner, Lehman, Harrison

Item Title: An Act concemning Senior Rental Leases for the purpose of amending the Landlord-Tenant
Code to provide certain senior tenants with twenty-four month residential leases; to establish
the Senior Tenant Rental Leases Program; to provide for the administration and notice of the
Program; and generally relating to senior tenant rental leases in the County.

Drafter: Kathleen H. Canning, Legislative Officer

Resource Personnel: Wanika Fisher,Council District 2

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented: 7/21/2015 Executive Action: 11/13/2015 S
Committee Referral: -~ 7/21/2015 - THE Effective Date: 12/26/2015
Committee Action: 9/24/2015 - FAV(A)

Date Introduced: 10/6/2015

Public Hearing: 11/3/2015 - 10:00 AM

Council Action (1) 11/3/2015 - ENACTED

Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:-, DT:A, KT:A, TT:A

Pass/Fail: P

Remarks:

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS:
13-138, 13-161, 13-165, 13-166, 13-167

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Transportation. Housing and Environment Committee Date 9/24/2015
September 24th, 2015

Committee Vote: Favorable with Amendments, 5-0 (In favor: Council Members Lehman, Turner, Taveras, Franklin
and Glaros)

Staff provided a summary of the bill and referral comments that were received. CB-59-2015 amends the
Landlord-Tenant Code to provide certain senior tenants with twenty-four month residential leases; to provide for the
administration and notice of the Program; and generally relating to senior tenants.

Eric Brown, Director, Department of Housing and Community Development, and Ron Weinholt of AOBA provided
testimony.

Amendments that were accepted are as follows:













































CB-029-2015(Draft 1) Page 2 of 2

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:
(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

Thé proposed legislation requires the decertification of businesses that are improperly certified as minority business
enterprises.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:




R = o I = ) U N P O

[ o R T e e T o e S U Y
L == R o < e T = ) N R -NU U'S B NG B )

DR-2

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
' 2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-84-2015

Chapter No. 54
Proposed and Presented by Council Member Franklin and Davis
Introduced by Council Members Franklin, Davis, Toles and Turner

Co-Sponsors

Date of Introduction October 13, 2015

BILL
AN ACT concerning
Building and Grading Permits

For the purpose of establishing a fifteen-business-day goal as to the issuance of building and
grading permits for projects enrolled in the Department of Permitting, Inspections and
Enforcement’s Peer Review Program, subject to certain conditions.
BY repealing and reenacting with amendments:

SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.

Section 4-345,

The Prince George's County Code

(2011 Edition, 2014 Supplement),

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Section 4-345 of the Prince George's County Code be and the same is hereby
repealed and reenacted with amendments:

SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
DIVISION 5. ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS.
Sec. 4-345. Requirements for Grading, Building Construction, Removal, etc., generally,

(a) The regulations contained in this Subtitle and the provisions of its Divisions jointly
construed shall control all matters concerning grading, drainage, and erosion control, and the
construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use, location, occupancy, and

maintenance of all buildings and structures and their service equipment, and shall apply to

existing or proposed buildings and structures in the County, except such matters as are otherwise












CB-084-2015(Draft 2) Page2 of 2

enrolled in the Peer Review Program. Additionally, Proposed DR-2 clarifies what is included in the 15 business day
time frame review cycle.

Nathaniel Tutt, representing the County Executive, informed the committee of the Administration’s opposition to
CB-84-2015 because the bill codifies best efforts for agencies that are not within County governance.

James Estepp and Harold Johnson testified in support of the legislation.
The committee voted favorable including the amendments in Proposed DR-2.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:
(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

This bill establishes a 21 calendar day goal for the issuance of building and grading permits for projects enrolled in
the Department of Permitting, Inspections and Enforcement’s (DPIE) Peer Review Program. The Director of DPIE is
authorized to adopt and enforce regulations to implement this Act. DPIE is required to report on a semiannual basis to
the County Executive and the County Council on the building and/or grading projects in its Peer Review Program.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:

























Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

Meeting Date: 11/17/2015

Reference No.: CB-034-2015

Draft No.: )

Proposer(s): Turner, Glaros, Harrison, Lehman, Taveras, Toles

Sponsor(s): Turner, Glaros, Harrison, Lehman, Taveras, Toles

Item Title: An Act defining electronic cigarettes, regulating distribution, placement and packaging of
electronic cigarettes, and restricting smoking of electronic cigarettes inside of public housing,
senior citizen housing, and eating and drinking establishments.

Drafter: Leroy D. Maddox, Jr.,, Legislative Officer

Resource Personnel: Tomeka C. Bumbry,Chief of Staff

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented: 6/2/2015 Executive Action: 11/25/2015 S
Committee Referral: 6/2/2015 - HEHS Effective Date: 1/11/2016
Committee Action: 7/9/2015 - HELD

10/8/2015 - FAV(A)

Date Introduced: 10/20/2015

Public Hearing: 11/17/2015 - 10:00 AM

Council Action (1) 11/17/2015 - ENACTED

Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:N, DT:A, KT:A, TT:A
Pass/Fail: P

Remarks:

12-201, 12-202, 12-203, 12-204.01, 19-130, 19-135
COMMITTEE REPORTS:

HEALTH. EDUCATION AND HUMAN SERVICES COMMITTEE Date 10/8/2015
Committee Vote: Favorable as Amended 4-0-1 (In favor: Council Members Toles, Davis, Franklin, Glaros; Abstain:
Patterson)

Staff provided an overview of the legislation indicating that CB-34-2015 was previously held in committee on July 9,
2015. The Health Officer spoke in support of CB-34-2015 indicating that there would not be a fiscal impact and
would purchase items with their undercover agent. The Director of Housing and Community Development spoke in
support of the bill indicating that their Public Housing “No Smoking Policy” would be amended to include
e-cigarettes.

A representative from the University Of Maryland School Of Law spoke in support of CB-34-2015 providing
additional information and responses to the Committee questions.

A Maryland Group Against Smoker’s Pollution (MDGASP) representative spoke in support of the legislation and






CB-034-2015(Draft 2) Page 3 of 3

A representative from Maryland Group Against Smoker’s Pollution (MDGASP) spoke in support of CB-34-2015 on
behalf of the more than 250 members who reside in Prince George’s County. The representative spoke about the
product being manufactured by over 250 companies and is unregulated and that the opposition will probably request
an exemption for bars and restaurants as long as these places display signs saying vaping is permitted. The
representative urged the Council to not support such requests and to support CB-34-2015 as presented.

The Office of Audits and Investigations determined that enactment of CB-34-2015 should not have an adverse fiscal
impact on the County since smoking has been previously deemed unlawful with the aforementioned locations. The
proposed bill simply adds the smoking, or vaporing, or electronic cigarettes as an additional unlawful activity.

CB-34-2015 was held in committee for further consideration of proposed amendments.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:
(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

The need to address issues involving electronic cigarettes.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:







SR s T = U U, TR NS 'S T NG T

I e o o T e T e S S S U
L L R = RN - R - T B o N O S SO T S N

[3399P Emergency Dispatch Aide,
P14] [($32,809 — $68,262)]

[3398P Emergency Dispatch Aide,
Senior, P15] [($34,450 - $71,675)]

[3400P Emergency Dispatcher I,
P16] [($36,173 - $75,259)]

[3401P Emergency Dispatcher II,
P18] [($39.880 - $82,973)]

[3402P Emergency Dispatcher III,
P207 [($43,968 - $91,477)]

[3403P Emergency Dispatcher IV,
P22] [($48.475 - $100,854)]

CB-63-2015 (DR-1)

3399P Public Safety Emergency Call Taker I.
P14 ($32.809 — $68.262)

3398P Public Safety Emergency Call Taker II.
P15 ($34.450 - $71.675)

3308P Public Safety Emergency Call Taker ITI,
G20 ($44.031 - $85.667)

3400P Public Safety Emergency Dispatcher I,
P16 ($36.173 - $75.259)

3401P Public Safety Emergency Dispatcher II.
P18 ($39.880 - $82.973)

3402P Public Safety Emergency Dispatcher II1.
P20 ($43.968 - $91.477)

3403P Public Safety Emergency Shift

Supervisor,
P22 ($48.475 - $100.854)

3409G Public Safety Communications

Operations Supervisor.
G24 (853.521 - $104.129)



















O 0 N Y W B W N —

T —
o = o

CB-85-2015 (DR-2)

Division. The fees for single-family rental facilities shall only be amended by Council
Resolution.

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby
declared to be severable; and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,
sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining
words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this
Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, subparagraph, subsection,
or section.

SECTION 3. BEIT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)
calendar days after it becomes law.

Adopted this _17" day of November , 2015.

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE
GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

o A

Mel Franklin
Chairman
ATTEST:
%c&s% ‘_)ero-?,&'
Redis C. Floyd
Clerk of the Council
APPROVED:

DATE: \ovemiper 23,2015 BY:R‘L—/‘Q«(/)B_\

Rudhern L. Baker, 1
County Executive







CB-085-2015(Draft 2) Page 2 of 2

1. On page 1, line 21; after “for a new license is”, insert applied for within 30 days following settlement,

2. On page 2, line 1-4; delete [submitted to the Director prior to actual change of ownership or control of the property
or its assets. In addition to other required information, a purchaser's application for a license must be accompanied
by a certification of the date transfer is to take place.]

3. On page 2, line 6-7; delete [late fee of an additional twenty percent (20%) of the prorated licensing fee due]
4. On page 2, line 7; insert penalty of up to one thousand dollars ($1,000), after “Subsection (b) of this Section”
5. On page 2, line 21; delete [twenty percent (20%)]

6. On page 2, line 21-22; insert of up to one thousand dollar ($1,000), after the word “penalty”

October 1st, 2015

Staff provided a summary of the resolution and referral comments that were received. Susan Hubbard, Prince
Georges County, Department of Permits, Inspections and Enforcement, Martin Harris, Prince Georges County,
Department of Public Works and Transportation, and Mike Graziano with the Prince Georges County Realtors

Association provided additional information and answered questions in committee.

The Office of Law determined that CB-85-2015 was in proper legislative form and without legal impediments to its
adoption.

The Office of Audits and Investigation indicated there will be a fiscal impact on the County as a result of adopting
CB-85-2015. However, an accurate approximation of the fiscal impact on the County cannot be determined at this
time.

Staff provided a summary of the resolution and referral comments that were received. CB-85-2015, concerns Illegal
Rental Property for the purpose prohibiting a new owner from operating a property without a valid license; providing
for a penalty for rental property owners who operate property without a valid license, and generally relating to rental
property licensing.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:

(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

This bill is regarding illegal rental property. This bill prohibits a new owner from operating a property without a valid
license. The penalty for rental property owners who operate property without a valid license is $1,000 for each month
or portion of a month.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:




]

o

D00 -1 Oy uh

10
11
12

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

DR-2

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-89-2015

Chapter No. 78

Proposed and Presented by _ The Chairman (by request — County Executive)

Introduced by Council Members Toles, Franklin and Taveras

Co-Sponsors

Date of Introduction October 20, 2015

BILL
AN ACT concerning
Food Service Facilities

For the purpose of amending certain definitions and enforcement procedures for food service
facilities to comply with recent changes to the Code of Maryland Regulations 10.15.03 and
generally relating to food service facilities and food service manager certifications.
BY repealing and reenacting with amendments:

SUBTITLE 12. HEALTH.

Sections 12-104, 12-105, 12.105.01, 12-106, 12-107,

12-108, 12-111, 12-111.01, 12-112, 12-113, 12-114,

and 12-115

The Prince George's County Code

(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).
BY adding:

SUBTITLE 12. HEALTH.

Sections 12-114.01, 12-114.02, and 12-115.01

The Prince George's County Code

(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,

Maryland, that Sections 12-104, 12-105, 12.105.01, 12-106, 12-107, 12-108, 12-111, 12-111.01,
12-112, 12-113, 12-114, and 12-115 of the Prince George's County Code be and the same are

hereby repealed and reenacted with the following amendments:



e e = D - US T N Sy

L I T o o T o S O e O e |
e = = L = e e ¥ i = T U= - - TR T S W o = O

CB-89-2015 (DR-2)

SUBTITLE 12. HEALTH.
DIVISION 2. FOOD SERVICE FACILITIES.
SUBDIVISION 2., Couﬁ'ry ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, AND CHANGES TO THE STATE
REGULATIONS.
Sec. 12-104. Definitions.
(@) In addition to the definition of terms contained in the State regulations adopted by

reference in this Division, the following definitions and terminolo gy shall apply and are
applicable to such provisions adopted by reference:

* * % ® * * * * *

(2.1) Catering Service shall mean the preparation or provision and the serving of food

and drink at the provider’s premises or elsewhere where a prearranged amount of food is

provided with or without charge for a group’s event or function: an individual is not charged for

a single portion of food. The provider’s premises must be a licensed commercial facility.

[2.1] (2.2) Certified food service manager shall mean a person in a supervisory

capacity who has obtained training in food sanitation or has otherwise demonstrated knowledge
of good food handling practices, and has obtained the certification document issued by the
Department.

(2.3) Chronic Offender shall mean any person who operates a food service facility or

who manages a shopping center containing two (2) or more food service facilities. and who

demonstrates a pattern of violating regulations. being evidenced by:

(A) On two (2) or more occasions within a twelve (12) month period. suspension

of the food service facility permit pursuant to Section 12-111 of this Subdivision: and/or

(B) Notices of proven violations of regulations under this Division which do not

result in a permit suspension. all rights of appeal having been exhausted: or

(€) On two (2) or more occasions within a twelve (12) month period. the Health

Officer requires a compliance hearing.

* % * * * * * * %

(4) Depot shall mean a food service facility permitted by the Department or other
regulatory agency sanctioned by the approving authority which provides one or more of the
following services to mobile special food service facilities on a routine basis: food, food

preparation or storage, utensil wash facilities, potable water, or waste disposal facilities.

















































R = e T = L T U R "~ N o B

| T S R e e T e e Yy VY U WY
_— O DO 0 N e B W N o= O

DR-3
COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
2015 Legislative Session

Bill No. CB-90-2015
Chapter No. 79

Proposed and Presented by The Chairman (by request — County Executive)

Introduced by  Council Members Turner, Lehman, Harrison, Franklin, Davis, Taveras,

and Glaros

Date of Introduction October 20, 2015

BILL
AN ACT concerning the
Building Code of Prince George’s County
For the purpose of updating the provisions of the Building Code of Prince George’s County (the
“County™) to conform to the 2015 editions of the International Building Code, the International
Mechanical Code, the International Energy Conservation Code and the International Residential
Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings.
BY repealing and reenacting with amendments:
SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
Sections 4-101, 4-106, 4-107, 4-111, 4-112, 4-113, 4-118, 4-119, 4-
120, 4-121, 4-123, 4-125, 4-127, 4-131, 4-138, 4-141, 4-142, 4-149, 4-
156, 4-157, 4-158, 4-163, 4-165, 4-172, 4-173, 4-180, 4-187, 4-189, 4-
190, 4-191, 4-196, 4-244, 4-245, 4-247, 4-249, 4-250, 4-251, 4-253, 4-
258, 4-259, 4-260, 4-261, 4-263, 4-345 and 4-352,
The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).
BY repealing:
SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
Sections 4-216, 4-217, 4-218, 4-219, 4-222, 4-223, 4-224, 4-254 and 4-
255,
The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).



B VS R WS

O 00 ~1 O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19

21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

BY adding:
SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
Sections 4-104, 4-143, 4-152,4-240.1, 4-243, 4-248
and 4-252,
The Prince George's County Code
(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BEIT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Sections 4-101, 4-106, 4-107, 4-111, 4-112, 4-113, 4-118, 4-119, 4-120, 4-121, 4-
123, 4-125, 4-127, 4-131, 4-138, 4-141, 4-142, 4-149, 4-156, 4-157, 4-158, 4-163, 4-165, 4-172,
4-173, 4-180, 4-187, 4-189, 4-190, 4-191, 4-196, 4-244, 4-245, 4-247, 4-249, 4-250, 4-251, 4-
253, 4-258, 4-259, 4-260, 4-261, 4-263, 4-345 and 4-352 of the Prince George's County Code be
and the same are hereby repealed and reenacted with the following amendments:

SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
DIVISION 1. BUILDING CODE.
SUBDIVISION 1. ADOPTION BY REFERENCE.
Sec. 4-101. Code - Adopted by Reference.

The following codes and standards are hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this
Subtitle with the same force and effect as those set out in full herein as the official Building Code
of Prince George's County, together with the changes, deletions, or modifications prescribed in
this Subtitle:

The International Building Code, [2012] 2015 Edition (hereinafter referred to as the IBC");

The International Mechanical Code, [2012] 2015 Edition (hereinafter referred to as the
T™C";

The International Energy Conservation Code, [2012] 2015 Edition (hereinafter referred to
as the TECC'); and

The International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, [2012] 2015
Edition (hereinafter referred to as the 'IRC").

The International Existing Building Code 2012 Edition (hereinafter referred to as the

IEBC).






WOo0 -1 Oy b B W D

| N S S I L e e et o TR S S S U
o = O W e Y W B WD = O

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

Code shall apply except where referenced in Section 413, [2012] 2015 IBC Combustible Storage
and Section 426, 2015 IBC Combustible Dusts. Grain Processing and Storage.

Sec. 4-107. Administration; Section 102, Applicability.

(a) Section 102.1 [is amended to read as follows: "General."] , General. Where, in any

specific case, different sections of this Code specify different materials, methods of construction,
or other requirements, the most restrictive standard shall apply. In addition, where there is
conflict between a general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall
apply. [In addition, the regulations as embodied in Division 3 of this Subtitle, shall control and
establish minimum requirements for grading, drainage, surface structures, erosion control of land
and stormwater management and shall establish procedures by which such requirements are to be
administered and enforced. Accordingly, whenever the words "buildings" or "structures," or
both, appear in the IBC and elsewhere, as may be applicable, the words "premises, site and land"
are to be considered as having been added to the text of such provisions.]

. (b) Section 102.2.1 [is added to read as follows: "Other requirements."] . Other

Requirements. The requirement of Chapter 11, "Accessibility," that buildings which use

turnstiles, cart corrals, or other interior or exterior traffic control devices and which are required
to have a clearly marked route which shall not be obstructed by locked gates during normai
business hours, shall apply to all existing buildings.

(¢) Section 102.3.1 [is added to read as follows: "Suspension of Approval."] . Suspension
of Approval. Whenever it is determined, however, that there is documentary evidence that the
use of a material or method approved herein would constitute a distinct threat to life or property,

the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee shall have the authority to

administratively suspend approval granted herein of such material or method. The [Building

Official] Director or the Director’s designee shall, within five (5) working days, request, in

writing, the County Council to confirm such administrative suspension by resolution of the

Council. Such written request of the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee shall

be submitted with sufficient technical data and record of national or local testing to substantiate
that the use of an approved method or material would constitute a distinct hazard to life or
property.

(d) Section 102.4.1 [is added to read as follows:] , Updated Standards. Where existing

standards or requirements adopted herein have been updated or superseded by the promulgating



B VS T L T —

o O oo ~J O Lh

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

authority, such revised standard or requirement shall be deemed as prima facie evidence of
compliance with the intent of the Subtitle.
Sec. 4-111. Administration; Section 105, Permits.

.(a) Section 105.2 [is amended to read as follows: "Work Exempt from Permit."] . Work

Exempt from Permit. Notwithstanding the foregoing, except for classified historic sites and

property located within Chesapeake Bay Critical Area Overlay Zones, permits shall not be
required for the following, provided that the construction does not result in any violation of this

Subtitle: a one- story detached accessory structure (tool. storage shed. playhouse and similar

uses) on one- and two-family dwelling properties with less than one hundred fifty (150) square
feet of floor space not designed or intended for occupation or habitation and limited to one (1)
accessory structure only per property; all forms of paving less than five hundred (500) square
feet except for parking surfaces; a retaining wall not greater than two (2) feet in height unless
supporting a structure; fence not greater than four (4) feet in height; and satellite dishes not
greater than two (2) feet in diameter and height. Except for classified Historic Sites, permits
shall not be required for installation of siding, roofing, or storm door[s or windows, or retrofit
insulations] installations, provided that no construction is involved.

(b) Section 105.2.2 [is amended to read as follows: "Repairs."] , Repairs. Application or

notice to the [Code Official] Director or the Director’s designee is not required for ordinary

repairs to structures, replacement of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical
equipment to approved permanently installed receptacles. Ordinary repairs shall include the
replacement in kind of the following: siding, roofing, gutters, leaders and downspouts, private
sidewalks, driveways, patios, awnings and canopies, equipment, cabinets, slabs, handrails,
window screens, storm doors and [windows,] recirculation range hoods[, and windows].

(¢) Section 105.2.2.1 [is added to read as follows: "Repairs to Residential Structures."] ,
Repairs to Residential Structures. Use Group R-1, Use Group R-2, Use Group R-3, and Use

Group R-4 which, because of lack of maintenance or structural damage due to a fire, explosion,
or natural causes, [undergo repairs or renovations] which, in the opinion of the [Fire Code

Official] Director or the Director’s designee, exceed fifty percent (50%) [of the assessed value]

of the building shall have an approved automatic fire sprinkler system installed throughout the
building as part of the scope of repairs to be completed. Computation of the cost of repairs for

purposes of this Section shall exclude carpeting replacement, electrical panel capacity upgrades,

Ln









R e e o S O e N U L O

s T s T o e e O N AU U
e — N I - T T = N U U N S

o]
[

23

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(i) Section 105.5.1 [is added to read as follows: "Expiration of Permit and Correction of

Code Violations."] , Expiration of Permit and Correction of Code Violations. Any permit issued

for residential property to correct a building code or housing code violation issued pursuant to
Subtitle 4 or Subtitle 13 of the County Code shall be issued only for a period of time reasonably
necessary to correct the violation, not to exceed ninety (90) days. The initial period of the permit

shall be established by the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee based upon the

extent of the work required to correct the violation. The permit may be extended or renewed for
an additional period of one hundred eighty (180) days if, in the opinion of the [Building Official]

Director or the Director’s designee, the applicant has demonstrated substantial progress to

complete the work in accordance with the permit and has demonstrated substantial justification
for failure to complete the work within the period of the permit. The Board of Administrative
Appeals shall have no authority to grant an extension to the period of the permit.

(k) Section 105.8 [is added to read as follows: "Rural Tier."] , Rural Tier. Where the
property is located in the Rural Tier, as delineated in the Approved General Plan, the validity
period of building permits and the requirements for granting extensions to the validity periods of
expired building permits shall conform to Subtitle 27, Part 18 of the County Code (Interim
Development Ordinance).

(1) Section 105.9 [is added to read as follows: “Building Location.”] , Building Location.

No permit for building shall be issued for a structure that overlaps the County line. Location of
the County line on the site plan shall be certified by a Professional Land Surveyor.
(m) Section 105.10 [is added to read as follows: “Date and Hours of Operation Limits.”] ,

Date and Hours of Operation Limits. All permits shall be issued with date and hours of

operation limits listed as determined by the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s

designee. All permits shall be issued indicating that no work shall be performed during the hours
0f 9:00 p.m. to 7:00 a.m., unless work is performed pursuant to Section 4-120 of this Subtitle.

Sec. 4-112. Administration; Section 105, Permits.
(a) A new Subsection 105.5.1, [titled "Expiration of permit," is added to read as follows:]

Expiration of Permit. Any permit issued for property within the area of a pending Sectional Map

Amendment, as provided for in Subtitle 27 of this Code, that is rezoned to a less intense zone,
shall expire on its own terms upon approval of the Sectional Map Amendment by the District

Council, if a completed building foundation for a use not permitted in the less intense zone has



O 00 ~1 O h s W B e

[ T L e s e L e L e e e T e e
R - e N " I o e S = RN = S o o T R o L L T O B e |

3

o

(¥

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

not been completed. The [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee shall notify the

permit holder of the expiration of the permit.
(b) A new Subsection 105.5.2, [titled "Expiration of permit; correction of code violations,"

is added to read as follows:] Expiration of Permit: Correction of Code Violations. Any permit

issued for residential property to correct a building code or housing code violation, issued
pursuant to Subtitle 4 or Subtitle 13 of this Code, shall be issued only for a period of time
reasonably necessary to correct the violation, not to exceed 90 days. The initial period of the

permit shall be established by the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee based

upon the extent of the work required to correct the violation. The permit may be extended or
renewed for an additional period of 180 days if, in the opinion of the [Building Official] Director

or the Director’s designee, the applicant has demonstrated substantial progress to complete the

work in accordance with the permit and has demonstrated substantial justification for failure to
complete the work within the period of the permit. The Board of Appeals shall have no authority
to grant an extension to the period of the permit.

(c) Section 105.6 [is amended to read as follows: "Suspension or Revocation and

Reissuance of Permits."] . Suspension or Revocation and Reissuance or Permits. The [Building

Official] Director or the Director’s designee is authorized to suspend or revoke a permit issued

under the provisions of this Code as follows: (1) whenever the permit is issued in error, (2)
incorrectly, (3) inaccurately, (4) in an incomplete manner, (5) [or] for any reason that is
necessary to maintain the health, safety and welfare of the public, (6) [or] in violation of any

ordinance, regulation or any of the provisions of this Code, and (7) [and The Director of

Permitting, Inspections, and Enforcement] the Director or the Director’s designee, in
consultation with the Police Department and the Fire/EMS Department, [as appropriate,] shall
have the authority to deny, suspend, or revoke any application or permit under the provisions of
this Division and upon a violation of this Division. In addition, the failure to have utility lines
located on site through the Utility Service Protection Center ("Miss Utility") and any nonmember
utilities prior to starting any excavation deeper than twelve (12) inches will result in permit
revocation.”

(1) A permit under which no work is commenced within one hundred eighty (180)

days after issuance shall expire and become null and void; provided, however, that the [Building



= 2 o

O G0 1 O

10

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

26
27
28
29
30
31

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

Official] Director or the Director’s designee may extend the time herein not to exceed an

additional one hundred eighty (180) days upon sufficient justification shown.

(2) A permit under which work has been started and later suspended or discontinued
shall expire and become null and void six (6) months after the work has stopped. Work will be
considered suspended or discontinued when the builder fails to prosecute the work so as to
ensure completion within a reasonable period of time considering the type of construction

involved. The [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee may extend the time herein

not to exceed an additional twelve (12) months upon sufficient justification shown.
(3) A permit issued in error or not in compliance with County Code at time of

issuance may be suspended by the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee.

(4) When a permit has expired for failure to commence work, it may be renewed
within a period of thirty (30) days from the date of expiration if the conditions under which the
permit was originally issued have remained unchanged and there has been no change in law or
ordinance that would adversely affect the permit. A fee shall be collected for each renewal;
[provided,] however, [that] no permit may be renewed more than two (2) times.

(5) Whenever the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee determines

by inspection that work started on any building or structure for which a permit has been issued
has been suspended for a period of six (6) months, the owner of the property upon which the
structure is located, or other person or agent in control of said property, shall, within thirty (30)
days from the receipt of written notice from the Department, obtain a new or renewal permit to
complete the required work and diligently pursue the work to completion, or shall remove work
not completed or demolish the incomplete structures or buildings within sixty (60) days from the
date of the printed notice.

(6) Permits suspended for failure to comply with the County Code or ordinances may

be reinstated by the [Building Official] Director or the Director’s designee upon compliance or

approved validation.

(7) A permit issued for property within the area of a pending Sectional Map
Amendment, as provided for in Subtitle 27 of this Code, that is rezoned to a less intense zone,
shall expire if a completed building foundation for a use not permitted in the less intense zone
has not been constructed pursuant to a validly issued permit prior to District Council approval of

the Sectional Map Amendment. The determination of the [Building Official] Director or the

10









O oo ~J1 h Lh = Lo | ]

S e e L L o T T
C\U\#WMD—'O\DOO*—JO\MJ&L}JMD—*C}

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(9) Fire hydrant locations, fire department connection locations, and emergency fire
and medical vehicle access;

(10) Emergency lighting and emergency power systems;

(11) Applicable provisions of Chapter 4 of the IBC, "Special Detailed Requirements
Based on Use and Occupancy"; and

(12) Compliance with applicable NFPA Codes and Standards for specific processes,
materials, or hazards which are referenced within the IBC or the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code.
A written Fire Protection Engineering Design Evaluation (FPEDE) concerning these items shall

be submitted with the plans accompanying the application for a building permit. It shall be in the

format established by the [Fire Code Official] Director or the Director’s designee and shall be
signed and sealed by the prepérer. If, in the course of performing the FPEDE, the evaluating fire
protection engineer determines that there are fire related code deficiencies in the drawing or
specifications, all such deficiencies shall be remedied prior to the submittal of the FPEDE and
the building permit application and drawings. The FPEDE must include a signed and sealed
statement by both the evaluating fire protection engineer and the engineer or architect of record
attesting: "These drawings and specifications are in full compliance with the fire safety
provisions of all adopted State and local Building Code, Fire Codes, Mechanical Codes, local
amendments and referenced codes and standards to the best of their knowledge and belief."

(d) Section 107.3.4.2.1 [is added to read as follows: "] ,Use Groups and Fire Protection
Systems Requiring a Fire Protection Engineering Design Evaluation (FPEDE).["] A[n] FPEDE
is required for the following buildings or fire protection systems for which a building permit
application is made:

(1) Use Group "A", Assembly, with an occupant load of one thousand (1,000)
persons or more;

(2) Use Group "H", High Hazard;

(3) Use Groups "I-2” and “I-3", Institutional;

(4) Use Group "M", all covered malls and open malls exceeding thirty thousand
(30,000) square feet in gross area;

(3) All Use Groups with an estimated construction cost of Five Million Dollars
($5,000,000.00) or more;






p—

O 00 =1 O h = W o

10

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

agreement indicating responsibility for correction of all deficiencies or violations cited by the
Department of Permitting, Inspections, and Enforcement by a date certain. The provisions of
this Section are not applicable when a new dwelling unit is purchased for resale as a new
dwelling unit.

(1) Nothing herein shall be construed to relieve a builder or seller of a dwelling unit
from any responsibility for correction of building code violations which were caused, created, or
constructed by the builder or seller, and the transfer of title to the property to a subsequent owner
shall not relieve the builder or seller of the responsibility for making such corrections.

(b) Section 111.1.2 [is added to read as follows: "Issuance of Certificates of Use and

Occupancy."] . Issuance of Certificates of Occupancy. No [c]Certificate of [use and

0]Occupancy for any building or structure, erected, altered, repaired, changed to a different use
group, or transferred to a new owner or occupant shall be issued unless such building or structure
was erected, altered, or repaired and is otherwise in compliance with the provisions of this
Division and other provisions of State or local laws, ordinances, and regulations.

Exception: All buildings which undergo a change of owner or tenant only with no change
of intended use group are not required to meet the fire safety requirements for a new building in
order to obtain a [Use and] Certificate of Occupancy [Certificate]. Such buildings are required to
comply with the provisions of state and local laws, ordinances, and regulations with respect to
fire safety for existing buildings.

(c) Section 111.2.1 [is added to read as follows: "Change of Use Group, Owner or

Tenant."] . Change of Use Group. Owner or Tenant. No change in use group, owner, or tenant of

a building, structure, or land shall be permitted, wholly or in part, until a new[ use and

occupancy permit] Certificate of Occupancy has been issued by the Building Official certifying

compliance with applicable parts of this Subtitle and other applicable State or local laws,
ordinances, and regulations. This provision shall not apply to a change of tenant for R-2, change
of owner or tenant for R-3, or change of tenant for R-4 structures.

(d) Section 111.5 [is added to read as follows: “Uninhabitable Dwellings."] ,
Uninhabitable Dwellings. When the Director [of Permitting, Inspections, and Enforcement] or

the Director’s designee has determined that a dwelling is unfit for human habitation pursuant to

Subtitle 13 of the County Code and the dwelling has remained unoccupied for a subsequent.
period of one hundred eighty (180) days, the Director or the Director’s designee shall revoke the

15






o e 1 v b B W R

s e L e e L e L s R o o e T e o S e U U Y
R e T T = Y " I oS e e B = B B e SR O T SO 'S T O S

2

o

L

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

be made when it is claimed that the true intent of the IBC/IRC or of this Subtitle has been
incorrectly interpreted or applied. Notice of an appeal shall be in writing and filed within thirty

(30) days after the decision is rendered by the Director or the Director’s desi,qnee: provided,

however. that in the case of a structure or dwelling unit which is unsafe or dangerous. or where

inadequate sediment control measures exist and sediment is leaving a site. and in any other

situation when the Director or the Director’s designee has determined that immediate corrective

action is necessary. the Director or the Director’s designee may. in the Director’s or the

Director’s designee’s order, limit the time for an appeal to a shorter period. The Board of

Administrative Appeals shall not have the power or duty to hear and decide an appeal regarding

the expiration of a permit pursuant to Section 4-352 of the County Code. Appeals hereunder

shall be in accordance with Subtitle 2. Division 4, of the County Code.

(b) [Section 116.3.1 is added to read as follows: "Notice Involving Historic Resources."
If a building or structure found to be unsafe by the Building Official is an identified historic
resource on the Adopted and Approved Historic Sites and District Plan of Prince George's
County, Maryland, a copy of the notice shall also be sent to the Historic Preservation
Commission and demolition shall not be authorized without approval of the Historical
Preservation Commission, except when an emergency situation exists where there is actual and
immediate danger of collapse or failure of the building or structure, or any part thereof, which

would endanger human life.] Section 113.2. Construction in the One Hundred (100) Year

Floodplain.
(1) Variances for construction in the One Hundred (100) Year Floodplain shall be

issued by the Board of Administrative Appeals upon:

(A) A showing of good and sufficient cause:

(B) A determination that failure to grant the variance would result in exceptional
hardship to the applicant;

(C) A determination that the granting of a variance will not result in increased
flood heights. additional threats to public safety, extraordinary public expense. create nuisances.
cause fraud on or victimization of the public. or conflict with existing local laws or ordinances:

(D) A determination that the variance is the minimum necessary to afford relief

upon consideration of the flood hazard: and

17












(F'S)

O oo 1 N W I

10

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

[(g) Section 117.5 is added to read as follows: "Cost of Emergency Repairs". Costs
incurred in the performance of emergency work shall be paid from the treasury of the jurisdiction
on certificate of the Building Official. The legal counsel of the jurisdiction shall institute
appropriate action against the owner of the premises where the unsafe condition was located for
recovery of such costs, including, but not limited to, certification for a tax lien as provided by
Section 117.7.]

[(h) Section 117.6 is added to read as follows: "Unsafe Equipment." Equipment deemed
unsafe by the Code Official shall not be operated after the date stated in the notice unless the
required repairs or changes have been made and the equipment has been approved, or unless an
extension of time has been secured from the Code Official in writing.]

[(i) Section 117.6.1 is added to read as follows: "Authority to Seal Equipment." In the
case of an emergency, the Code Official shall have the authority to seal out of service
immediately any unsafe device or equipment regulated by this Code.]

" [(G) Section 117.6.2 is added to read as follows: "Unlawful to Remove Seal." Any device
or equipment sealed out of service by the Code Official shall be plainly identified in an approved
manner. The identification shall not be tampered with, defaced or removed except by the Code
Official and shall indicate the reason for such sealing.]

[(k) Section 117.7 is added to read as follows: "Creation of a Tax Lien." There is created a
tax lien on real property for monies expended by the County for the making safe of buildings or
structures and/or abatement of other unsafe nuisances or conditions constituting a danger to the
public health and safety. Upon certification from the County Attorney that a tax lien has been
created, the amount of such lien shall be collected by the Director of Finance in the same manner
as other County real estate taxes.]

Sec. 4-121. Administration; Section 117, [Means of Appeals] Emergency Measures.

(a) [Section 117.1 is added to read as follows: "Application for Appeal." The owner or
occupant of a building or structure or any directly aggrieved person may appeal to the Board of
Administrative Appeals from a final decision of the Building Official. Application for appeal
may be made when it is claimed that the true intent of the IBC/IRC or of this Subtitle has been
incorrectly interpreted or applied. Notice of such appeal shall be in writing and filed within
thirty (30) days after the decision is rendered by the Building Official; provided, however, that in

the case of a structure or dwelling unit which is unsafe or dangerous, or where inadequate

21












S~ W

o 00 ~1 O Wn

10
11
12

14
15
16
17
18
19

21
2
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(f) Section 117.4. Emergency Repairs. For the purpose of this Section. the Director or the

Director’s designee shall employ the necessary labor and materials to perform the required work

as expeditiously as possible.

(g) Section 117.5. Cost of Emergency Repairs. Costs incurred in the performance of

emergency work shall be paid from the treasury of the jurisdiction on certificate of the Building

Official. The legal counsel of the jurisdiction shall institute appropriate action against the owner

of the premises where the unsafe condition was located for recovery of such costs. including. but

not limited to. certification for a tax lien as provided by Section 117.7.
(h) Section 117.6. Unsafe Equipment. Equipment deemed unsafe by the Director or the

Director’s designee shall not be operated after the date stated in the notice unless the required

repairs or changes have been made and the equipment has been approved. or unless an extension

of time has been secured from the Director or the Director’s designee in writing.

(i) Section 117.6.1. Authority to Seal Equipment. In the case of an emergency. the

Director or the Director’s designee shall have the authority to seal out of service immediately

anv unsafe device or equipment regulated by this Code.

(3) Section 117.6.2, Unlawful to Remove Seal. Any device or equipment sealed out of

service by the Director or the Director’s designee shall be plainly identified in an approved

manner. The identification shall not be tampered with. defaced or removed except by the
Director or the Director’s designee and shall indicate the reason for such sealing.

(k) Section 117.7, Creation of a Tax Lien. There is created a tax lien on real property for

monies expended by the County for the making safe of buildings or structures and/or abatement

of other unsafe nuisances or conditions constituting a danger to the public health and safety.

Upon certification from the County Attorney that a tax lien has been created. the amount of such

lien shall be collected by the Director of Finance in the same manner as other County real estate

taxes.
Sec. 4-123. Definitions; Section 202, General Definitions.
[(a) The following amendments, additions, and/or deletions are made to Sections 202 of the
IBC and the IRC:] The following definition shall apply to Section 105 as set forth in Section 4-
1110f this Code:
[(1) The following definitions are inserted alphabetically into Section 202:]

25






R e o R T = 1 R O S O S

D (VS ] (o] b2 ra o] ] [ ] | [ o] [ —_ — — —_ — — —_ — — —
— O Do =1 N bh B W = O N D =1 N n b WO = O

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

| plan, an erosion and sedimentation concept plan, a vegetation management plan, and such other

plans relating to environmental systems as may be required by the Washington Suburban
Sanitary Commission, the Maryland-National Capital Park and Planning Commission, the Prince
George's County Health Department, the Prince George's County Department of the
Environment, the Prince George’s County Department of Permitting, Inspections, and
Enforcement or the Prince George's Soil Conservation District.]

Director: The Director of the Prince George's County, Maryland, Department of
Permitting, Inspections, and Enforcement or the Director's designee.

Hot Water Supply Heater: A pressure vessel directly fired by oil, gas, or
electricity and which does not exceed the following limitation: two hundred thousand (200,000)
British thermal units per hour (Btwhr) input, and two hundred (200) degrees Fahrenheit
temperature, and nominal water capacity of one hundred twenty (120) gallons.

[(2) The definition of "occupancy" is amended to read as follows:]

Local Fire Department: Any full-time or volunteer fire department located

within three (3) miles of the building.

Occupancy: The ownership or tenancy of a building, structure, or land.

[(3) The following definition shall apply to Section 105 as set forth in Section 4-111
of this Code:]

[Building Foundation: The placement of footings that will adequately and safely
support all superimposed live and special loads of the building or structure for which the
building permit has been issued, and that complies with all requirements of Chapter 18 of the
IBC and Chapter 4 of the IRC.]

Public Way: A paved thoroughfare at least twenty-one (21) feet in width which

is located on privately owned. privately maintained property but is designated for public use or

which is publicly owned and maintained and which must be kept accessible at all times to the

local fire department. This public way shall not be farther from the building than will allow the

fire department aerial equipment to reach seventy-five (75) feet in height.

Sec. 4-125. Use and Occupancy Classification; Section 302; Classification.
(a) Section 302.1 [is amended to read as follows: "General."] . General. Structures, or
portions of structures, shall be classified with respect to occupancy in one or more of the groups

listed [below] in this section. A room or space that is intended to be occupied at different times

27












A= R T = S U T e 7 R o R

LS VT D = D o T o R U S o [N S S I o U R o B o M el e B o B oy —
(o == R Vs T+ = O - o B B e T N S = S B = I SO - o

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

operated emergency lighting unit. The type, arrangement, and functions of the fire command
station and emergency fire alarm must comply with Section 911, "Fire Command Center" and
shall be subject to approval by the fFire Code Official or the Fire Code Official's authorized

representative} [Director or the Director’s designee].

Sec. 4-138. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy; Section 415, Use
Groups H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4 and H-5.
(a) Section [415.8.2.2.1 is added to read as follows: "Underground Storage."] .
415.9.1.2.1. Underground Storage. All underground storage tanks for flammable or combustible

liquids shall be separated from adjacent property lines and buildings by not less than five (5)
feet.

Sec. 4-141. General Building Heights and Areas; Section 506 Building Area Modifications.
(a) Section [506.2.3 is added to read as follows: "Minimum Accessible Perimeter."]
506.3.4 Minimum Accessible Perimeter. All buildings and structures must have at least twenty-
five (25) percent of the building perimeter fronting on a street or other unoccupied space not less

than thirty (30) feet in width which is accessible from a road or a posted fire lane not less than
twenty (22) feet in width. The access road or fire lane and the unoccupied space must be capable
of providing fire apparatus access under all weather conditions to within one hundred (100) feet
of the building or structure.

Exceptions: (1) Buildings which are fully sprinklered in accordance with Section 903, and
(2) Structures and buildings in Use Group U and U-PU.

(b) Section [506.2.4 is added to read as follows: "Arrangement of Access."] 506.3.5.
Arrangement of Access. Access shall be in accordance with the 2012 NFPA 1141, ["Fire

Protection in Planned Building Groups,"] Standard for Fire Protection Infrastructure for Land

Development in Wildland, Rural and Suburban Area, except as otherwise provided for in this

Subtitle.

Sec. 4-142. General Building Heights and Areas; Section 507, Unlimited Area Buildings.
(a) [Section 507.3 is amended to read as follows: "Sprinklered one-story." The areaof a

one-story Group A-4, B, F, M or S building, of other than Type 5 construction, shall not be

limited when the building is provided with an automatic sprinkler system throughout in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and is surrounded and adjoined by public ways or yards not

less than sixty (60) feet in width.]

31






O o0 1 Oy U B W D e

R o L e L L e e e e e T e e S S S O S Y
e e T X e T = < T S o | R 7S R O = Y o T .« T S I s YR & T U 'S R 0 TR S

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

[Fire Code Official] Director or the Director’s designee a notarized statement acknowledging

that future use of the unprotected sporting floor areas of the facility will be limited to sporting
activities of a low hazard nature with minimal occupant loadings and no combustibility of
contents and furnishings other than necessary to the sporting events.
Sec. 4-149. Fire and Smoke Protection Features; Section 705, Exterior Walls.

(a) The following deletions are made to Sections 705.3 of the IBC: Section 705.3

Buildings on the Same Lot. Delete Exception 2.

(b) Section 705.11 [is amended to read as follows: "Parapets."] . Parapets. Parapets shall
be provided on exterior walls of buildings. However, a parapet is not required on an exterior
wall where any of the following conditions (1) through (6) exist:

(1) The wall is not required to be fire-resistance rated in accordance with Table 602
because of fire separation distance;

(2) The building has an area of not more than one thousand (1,000) square feet on any
floor;

(3) The walls terminate at roofs of not less than two (2) hour fire-resistance-rated
construction or at a roof, including the deck and supporting construction, constructed entirely of
noncombustible materials;

(4) The exterior walls are one (1) hour fire-resistance-rated that terminate at the
underside of the roof sheathing, deck or slab, provided that conditions A through D below are
met:

(A) Where the roof or ceiling framing elements are parallel to the walls, such
framing and elements supporting such framing shall not be of less than one (1) hour fire-
resistance-rating construction for a width of four (4) feet, measured from the interior side of the
wall for Groups R and U and ten (10) feet for other occupancies;

(B) Where roof or ceiling framing elements are not parallel to the walls, the
entire span of such framing and elements supporting such framing shall not be of less than one
(1) hour fire-resistance-rated construction;

(C) Openings in the roof are not located within five (5) feet of the [OJone (1)
hour fire-resistance-rated exterior wall for Groups R and U and ten (10) feet for other
occupancies; and

(D) The entire building is provided with not less than a Class B roof covering.

33






OG0 N Oy b W e

(8] S T ] | S ] -2 o o o — — —t —_— — =t [u— — —
[ o R A T = L o ¥ S == 2N = S - - T S o )N ) S O 'S T N T S

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

or the Director’s designee as provided for in the joint Memorandum of Understanding between

the Fire Department and the Department of Permitting. Inspections and Enforcement prior to the

issuance of a building permit.

 Exception: Plans are not required for automatic sprirﬂder system modifications [or
installations] in commercial buildings involving ten (10) sprinkler heads or less[, and] that do not

[involving] involve the shifting of any cross mains or risers or create a more hydraulically

demanding remote area. Inspection and testing shall still be required after completion of the
work.

(b) Section 901.2.1.2 [is added to read as follows: "Review Assumptions."] . Review
Assumptions. The operational assumption during the review and inspection of all fire
suppression systems shall be as follows:

(1) Total area protection: All areas shall be protected, including, but not limited to
attics, bathrooms, closets, combustible concealed spaces, loading docks, and open areas beneath
the projection of the structure footprint, planned for storage or vehicle traffic; unless specifically
noted, and supported by a Section of this Code on the shop drawings submitted for review.

(2) Conditioned space: All areas through which any portion of a fire suppression
system passes shall be provided with an ambient temperature of no less than fortv (40) degrees
Fahrenheit unless specifically noted on the plans submitted for review.

(3) Code compliance: A note shall be placed on all plans submitted for review
indicating that the installation shall comply with required standards.

Sec. 4-158. Fire Protection Systems; Section 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems.

(a) Section 903.1, [is amended to read as follows: "General."] General. Approved
automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations
described in this Section. For the purposes of this Section, the fire area is defined as the
aggregate floor area enclosed and bounded by firewalls and exterior walls of a building.

[(b) Section 903.2.1 is amended to read as follows: "Group A." An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout buildings and portions thereof used as Group A occupancies
as provided in this Section. The automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the
floor area where the Group A occupancy is located and in all floors between the Group A

occupancy and the level of exit discharge.]






O o ~1 O W B W N

[ T 1 T N S e e e e L e e e
[ I s S o S S =, T ¥ T SN VR I S

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

same level as the level of exit discharge of the main entrance and exit, and the building owner
furnishes to the [Fire Code Official] Director or the Director’s designee a notarized statement
acknowledging that the future use of the unprotected sporting floor areas of the facility will be
limited to sporting activities of a low hazard nature with minimal occupant loadings and no
combustibility of the contents and furnishings other than necessary to the sporting events.

[(D](e) Section 903.2.7 [is amended to read as follows: "Group M."] . Group M. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings where the fire area containing
a Group M occupancy exceeds six thousand (6,000) square feet, or where more than two (2)
stories in height or where the combined fire area on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds twelve thousand (12,000) square feet or when used for the sales or display of
upholstered furniture or mattresses over five thousand (5,000) square feet.

[(@)]() Section 903.2.7.1 [is amended to read as follows: "High-Piled Storage."]. High-
Piled Storage. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in all buildings of Group M

where storage of merchandise is in high-piled or rack storage arrays. High-piled storage shall be
considered storage in excess of twelve (12) feet above the floor for purposes of this Section.

[(h)](g) Section 903.2.8 [is amended to read as follows: "Group R-2."],Group R-2. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group R-2 fire area.
The following reductions in construction requirements are permitted when a building of use
Group R-2 is fully sprinklered and is not over four (4) stories above grade on any side of the
building:

(1) Attic sprinklers may be omitted provided that the ceiling of the top level is of
five-eighths (5/8) inch fire code type gypsum board and the attic is draftstopped at each two (2)
units maximum and all ceiling ductwork penetrations are provided with UL listed ceiling
dampers;

(2) Section 11-258 of the County Code (County Fire Safety Law) requiring heat
detectors in apartments is not applicable;

(3) Balconies of apartments may be of combustible construction, provided the
balconies are sprinklered,;

(4) Sprinklers may be omitted from open-air exterior stair enclosures provided that a

Class A finish is used in the stairs;












R N = o I = e B R R

[ L T e N e e o L o L o T S e e T N e S ey
o e 1 O h B W o = OO N W = D

2

o

Lo

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

Sec. 4-180. Chapter 11 - Accessibility.

(a) Chapter 11 of the IBC relating to Accessibility is hereby replaced with the Maryland
Accessibility code set forth in the code of Maryland Regulations (COMAR) Section 05.02.02.

(b) The following provisions shall supplement the Maryland Accessibility Code.
Swimming [poll] pool access: All public swimming pools shall have an approved lift with a
capacity of not less than three hundred (300) pounds for ingress to and egress from the pool or a
suitable system of ramps which would readily and safely accomplish the same purpose.

(c) Ramps serving as the main means of egress or ingress for a building shall have a width
of not less than five (5) feet measured between the handrails.

[Exception: When exit-way ramps are constructed for R-3 and One- and Two-Family
Dwellings, they shall comply with IRC R311.]

Sec. 4-187. Structural Design; Section 1608, Snow Loads.

(a) Section 1608.1 [is amended to read as follows: "General."] . General. Design snow
loads shall be determined in accordance with Section 7 of ASCE 7, but the design roof load shall
not be less than that determined by Section 1607 of this Code. However, in no case shall a roof
be designed for less than thirty (30) per square foot (psf) snow load plus the drift.

(b) Section 1608.2. Ground Snow Loads. The minimum ground snow loads to be used in

determining the design snow loads for roofs. including snow drift shall be thirty five (35) pounds

per square foot (psf).
Sec. 4-189. Soils and Foundations; Section 1809, Shallow Foundation.
(a) Section [1805.5 is amended to read as follows: "Frost Protection."] 1809.5. Frost

Protection. Except when erected upon solid rock or otherwise protected from frost, foundation
walls, piers, and other permanent supports of all buildings and structures shall extend thirty (30)
inches below finished grade and placed on undisturbed ground or compacted fill material,
certified by a geotechnical engineer licensed to practice in the State of Maryland, and spread
footings of adequate size shall be provided when necessary to properly distribute the load within
the allowable bearing value of the soil, or such structures shall be supported on piles, piers or

pre-approved methods of ground improvement when solid earth to rock is not available.

Footings shall not be founded on frozen soils unless such frozen condition is of a permanent

character.

41






O 00 1 Oy L B W ) e

[ N N B e e e e e e Y e e T
= O D 0 N Oy AW N = O

22

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

pumps are not to be relied on for lowering high groundwater table.
(b) Section 1805.4.3.5 [is added to read as follows: “1805.4.3.5], Areaway Drains. All

open subsurface space adjacent to a building serving as an exit or entrance shall be provided with
a drain or drains. Such areaway drains shall be of approved material in accordance with

[Chapter 29 of this Building Code] the International Plumbing Code (IPC) and not less than two

(2) inches in diameter and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means [in accordance with
1807.4.2]. Areaway drains for areas exceeding 100 square feet shall be sized in accordance with
Section [1113] 1114 of the [2006] 2015 [International Plumbing Code] IPC and be a pre-
approved design.[”]

(¢) Section 1805.4.3.6 [is added to read as follows: “1805.4.3.6], Window Well Drains.
Window well areaways shall have drains. Window well areaways ten (10) square feet or less
may discharge to the subsoil drain through a [2]two-inch minimum diameter pipe.[”]

(d) Section 1805.4.3.7 [is added to read as follows: “1805.4.3.7], Foundation Weep Holes.
Where subsoil drains are required by Section [1807.4.2] 1805.4.2, foundations of hollow core
masonry shall have foundation weep holes. Weep holes shall be placed a maximum of 4-foot o/c
intervals and shall discharge into the aggregate of interior subsoil drainage system.["]

(e) Section 1805.4.3.8 [is added to read as follows: “1805.4.3.8], Site Grading. The
ground immediately adjacent to the foundation shall be sloped away from the building at a slope
of not less than one unit vertical in twelve (12) units horizontal (1:12) for a minimum distance of
5 feet (914 mm) measured perpendicular to the face of the wall or an approved alternate method
of diverting water away from the foundation shall be used. Consideration shall be given to the
possible additional settlement of the backfill when establishing the final ground level adjacent to
the foundation.["]

Sec. 4-196. Electrical; Section 2702, Emergency and Standby Power Systems.

Section 2702.2 [is amended to read as follows: "Where Required."] . Emergency and
Standby Power Systems. Where required, [E]emergency and standby power systems shall be
installed in accordance with the National Electrical Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, and shall
be provided where required by Section 2702.2.1 through 2702.2.20 of this Code.

[Note: A connection ahead of the service disconnecting means is not considered an

emergency system power source. |

SUBDIVISION 4. INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS.

43
























B W o

O 0o -1 Oy Lh

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(4) Section R-405.1.5 [is added to read as: “R-405.1.5], Window Well Drains.
Window well areaways shall have drains. Window well areaways 10 square feet or less may
discharge to the subsoil drain through a 2-inch minimum diameter pipe. Drains for window well
areaways greater than 1-0 square feet shall be installed in accordance with Section R-405.1.3.["]

(5) Section R-405.1.6 [is added to read as: “R-405.1.6], Foundation Weep Holes.
Where subsoil drains are required by Section R-405.1.1, foundations of hollow core masonry
shall have foundation weep holes. Weep holes shall be placed a maximum of 4-foot o/c intervals
and shall discharge into the aggregate of the interior subsoil drainage system.[”]

(6) Section R-405.1.7 [is added to read as follows: “R-405.1.7], Site Grading. The
ground immediately adjacent to the foundation shall be sloped away from the building at a slope
of not less than one unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1:12) for a minimum distance of 5 feet
(914 mm) measured perpendicular to the face of the wall or an approved alternate method of
diverting water away from the foundation shall be used. Consideration shall be given to the
possible additional settlement of the backfill when establishing the final ground level adjacent to
the foundation.[”]

(7) Section R-405.2, titled “Wood foundations” is deleted in its entirety.

Sec. 4-253. Engineered Floor Truss Systems; Section [R-326] R-502.8.3, Protection of
Structural Members.

(a) Section [R326.1 is added to read as follows: "Protection of Truss Framing Members."]
R-502.8.3. Protection of Truss Framing Members. All combustible truss framing members
which comprise a portion of a nonrated floor assembly shall be protected by the installation of a
ceiling. The ceiling material shall not be less than one-half (1/2) inch gypsum board or an
approved equivalent alternative material. The ceiling must be adequately supported by direct
mechanical fastening to the structural framing or be suspended by not less than No. 12 MSG
galvanized steel wire or by an equivalent method. Where combustible truss joist framing is used
as a portion of a required rated floor-ceiling assembly, the structural members shall be protected
in accordance with an appropriate tested and listed design.

Exceptions: _

(1) Buildings protected throughout, excluding crawlspaces less than forty-two (42)

inches in depth by an automatic sprinkler system; and

3l



o 0 1 O W e W N

L5 T S o o N O R T o B o T o T e e —
S Y %o 9 & U R LN S S Y Ao R ® R o= o

2

[a—y

19

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(2) Crawl spaces of not more than forty-two (42) inches in depth, measured from the
top of the floor surface above to the surface of the crawl space floor.
SUBDIVISION 5. INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE.
Sec. 4-258. Electrical Power and Lighting Systems (Mandatory). [C504.2.2.2. Occupancy
Sensors] C405.2.1 Occupant Sensor Controls.

Section [C405.2.2.2 is amended to read as follows: Occupancy sensors] C405.2.1 Occupant

sensor controls shall be installed in all classrooms, conference/meeting rooms, employee lunch

and break rooms, private offices, restrooms, storage rooms, janitorial closets, enclosed stairways,
and other spaces 300 square feet (28m2) or less enclosed by floor-to-ceiling height partitions.
These automatically turn off lights within 30 minutes of all occupants leaving the space, and
shall turn the lighting on to not more than 50 percent power.
Sec. 4-259. Electrical Power and Lighting Systems (Mandatory). [C405.2.3] C405.2.4.

: Specific Application Controls.

Section [C405.2.3 is amended to read as follows:] C405.2.4 7. Lighting for parking areas
shall have automatic controls so that after 15 minutes of non-activity, lighting power density can
be reduced by 30 percent.

Sec. 4-260. Electrical Power and Lighting Systems (Mandatory). [C405.8] C405.10. Solar
Energy Systems.

Section [C405.8. is added to read as follows:] C405.10. Provide adequate on-site access
for solar energy systems and provide interconnection pathways to building distribution.
Documentation must be provided through construction documents and the main electrical service
panel.

Sec. 4-261. Additional Efficiency Package Options. [C406.4] C406.5. On-site Renewable
Energy.

Section [C406.4 is amended to read as follows:] C406.5. Total minimum ratings of on-site
renewable energy systems shall comply with one of the following: 1. Provide not less than 1.75
Btu (1850 W), or not less than 0.50 watts per square foot (5.4 W/m2) or conditioned floor area.
2. Provide not less than 5 percent of the energy used within the building for building mechanical
and service water [hearing] heating equipment and lighting regulated in this chapter.

Sec. 4-263. Additional Efficiency Package Options. [C406.6] C406.9. Water Heating Needs.

Section [C406.6 is added to read as follows:] 406.9. Hotels, motels, hospitals, restaurants,

53












CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

(23) Partial Use and Occupancy.

(24) Special Investigation.

(25) Accessory Buildings such as Sheds, 150 Square Feet and Larger.
(26) Accessory Buildings such as Sheds, Smaller than 150 Square Feet.
(27) Sunrooms, Porches and Garages (attached or detached).

O 00 1 Oy L e W b

[ T N TR o T s T s R T T e e T T S B
B N = =T - - B = N U R SV R S e =

25

(28) Carports.

(29) Fire Damage.

(30) Driveways.

(31) Mobil/Replacement Homes.

(32) Fireplaces (One- and Two-Family Dwellings.
(33) Retaining Walls, Two Feet and Taller.

(34) Patios, Five Hundred Square Feet and Larger.
(35) Patios, under Five Hundred Square Feet.

(36) Pole Bases.

(37) Awnings.

(38) Open Pit.

(39) Waterproofing.

(40) Wheelchair Ramps.

(41) Roofing.

(42) Satellite Dishes, Two Feet in Diameter and Larger.

(43) Observation Stands.
(44) Solar Panels.
(45) Freestanding Signs.
(46) Wall Mounted Signs.
(47) Tanks, Above or Under Ground.
(48) Telecommunications Antennas.
(49) Telecommunications Towers.
(50) Electrical.
(51) Mechanical.
(52) Fire PROTECTION.
(A) Sprinkler Heads.

56


















O 0 0 N U B W R e

[ S S w—y
No= o

14
15
16

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

that Sections 4-104, 4-143, 4-152, 4-240.1, 4-243, 4-248 and 4-252 of the Prince George's
County Code be and the same are hereby added:
SUBTITLE 4. BUILDING.
DIVISION 1. BUILDING CODE.

SUBDIVISION 1. ADOPTION BY REFERENCE.

Sec. 4-104. Application of Administrative Provisions.
The administrative provisions of the International Building Code. as amended. Sections
4-106 through 4-121 shall control all administrative matters related to construction of buildings.

These provisions shall be applicable to the standards adopted in Section 4-101 and shall be

construed to be in concert as if they were set out in the administrative provisions of those

standards. Where a conflict arises. the provisions of the sections here-in amended by the Countv

shall control.

SUBDIVISION 2. AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE.
Sec. 4-143. General Building Heights and Areas; Section 509, Incidental Uses.
The following additions are made to Table 509 of the IBC:

Room or Area Separation and/or Protection
Storage areas' over 50 square feet notinan S or F 1 hour or Sprinkler
Storage areas: over 100 square feetnotinan S or F Sprinkler

' Storage areas include walk-in freezers and refrigerators.
Sec. 4-152. Floor and Roof Assemblies; Section 711, Dwelling Units and Sleeping Units.
The following deletions are made to Sections 711.2.4.3 of the IBC: Delete the Exception.

SUBDIVISION 4. INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO- FAMILY DWELLINGS.
Sec. 4-240.1 Building Planning: Sec. R-302, Fire Resistant Construction.

(a) _ Section R-302.2.2. Parapets. Parapets constructed in accordance with Section R-

302.2.3 shall be provided for townhouses as an extension of common exteriors or walls in

accordance with the following:

(1) Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at the same elevation. the

parapet shall extend not less than thirty (30) inches above the roof surfaces: and

(2) _Where roof structures adjacent to the wall or walls are at different elevations and

the higher roof is not more than thirty (30) inches above the lower roof. the parapet shall extend

62
















O o0 ~1 O U s W N

[ T 5 T NG TR N TR NG TR v B 6 T S I N T o R e e e e e e e
O 00 -1 O Wb B W R = OO e - Oy e W = O

CB-90-2015 (DR-3)

Sec. 4-252. Floors; Section R-502, Wood Floor Framing,
(a) The following addition is made to Section R-502 of the International Residential
Code:

(1) Section R-502.7.2. Floor joists adjacent and parallel to the exterior foundation

wall shall be provided with full-depth solid blocking. not less than two (2) inches nominal in

thickness. placed perpendicular to the joist at spacing not more than four (4) feet. The blocking

shall be nailed to the floor sheathing. the joist and the exterior rim joist/board.
Sec, M1503.4. Make Up Air Required.

(a) The following revision is made to Sec. 1503.4 Make Up Air Required of the
International Residential Code:

(1) M1503.4. Makeup air required. Exhaust hood systems capable of exhausting [in
excess of] more than 400 cubic feet per minute (0.19m3/s) shall be mechanically or
naturally provided with makeup air at a rate approximately equal to the exhaust air rate
in excess of 400 cubic feet per minute. Such makeup air systems shall be equipped with
not less than one damper. Each damper shall be a gravity damper or an electrically
operated damper that automatically opens when the exhaust system operates. Dampers
shall be accessible for inspection, service, repair and replacement without removing
permanent construction or any other ducts not connected to the damper being inspected,
serviced, repaired or replaced.

SECTION 4. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby
declared to be severable: and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,
sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining
words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this
Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, subparagraph, subsection,
or section.

SECTION 5. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect on forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.

67






Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

Meeting Date: 11/17/2015

Reference No.: CB-090-2015

Draft No.: 3

Proposer(s): County Executive

Sponsor(s): Turner, Lehman, Harrison, Franklin, Taveras, Glaros

Item Title: An Act amending the provisions of the Building Code of Prince George’s County to conform

to the 2015 Editions of the International Building Code, the International Mechanical Code,
the International Energy Conservation Code and the International Residential Code for One-
and Two-Family Dwellings.

Susan D. Hubbard, DPIE

Drafter:

Resource Personnel: Robbi Das,DPIE
- Bellur Ravishankar,DPIE

Karen Spears,DPIE

Edmund Kalie,DPIE
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY: )
Date Presented: 9/29/2015 Executive Action: 11/25/2015 S
Committee Referral: 9/29/2015 - THE Effective Date: 1/11/2016
Committee Action: 10/15/2015 - FAV(A)
Date Introduced: 10/20/2015
Public Hearing: 11/17/2015 - 10:00 AM
Council Action (1) 11/17/2015 - ENACTED
Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:A, DT:A, KT:-, TT:A
Pass/Fail: B

Remarks:

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS: )
04-101, 04-104, 04-106, 04-107, 04-111, 04-112, 04-113, 04-118, 04-119, 04-120, 04-121, 04-123, 04-125, 04-127,
04-131, 04-138, 04-141, 04-142, 04-143, 04-149, 04-152, 04-156, 04-157, 04-158, 04-163, 04-165, 04-172, 04-173,
04-180, 04-187, 04-189, 04-190, 04-191, 04-196, 04-216, 04-217, 04-218, 04-219, 04-222, 04-223, 04-224, 04-240,
04-243, 04-244, 04-245, 04-247, 04-249, 04-250, 04-251, 04-252, 04-253, 04-254, 04-255, 04-258, 04-259, 04-260,
04-261, 04-263, 04-345, 04-352, 04-428

COMMITTEE REPORTS:

Transportation, Housing and Environment Date 10/15/2015
Committee Vote: Favorable with Amendments, 4-0 (In favor: Council Members Lehman Turner, Glaros and
Taveras)

The Legislative Officer provided a summary of the bill and referral comments that were received. CB-90 - 2015
concerns THE BUILDING CODE OF PRINCE GEORGE’S COUNTY for the purpose of updating the provisions of
the Building Code of Prince George’s County (the “County”™) to conform to the 2015 editions of the International












E=R SR I = T U, R - VS B 6 I S

(VS B s | L e e e o T N T o T T g U PO
—_— i O Co ~1 [#,3 Ln 4= LFS] 2 — = O o ~] {w wn = (83 2 — =

CB-91-2015 (DR-1)

(2011 Edition; 2014 Supplement).

SECTION 1. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,
Maryland, that Sections 9-101, 9-104, 9-104.01, 9-106, 9-107.01, 9-108.01, 9-108.02, 9-108.03,
9-109.01, 9-109.02, 9-117, 9-118, 9-122, 9-123, and 9-124 of the Prince George's County Code
be and the same are hereby repealed and reenacted with the following amendments:

SUBTITLE 9. ELECTRICITY.
DIVISION 1. ELECTRICAL CODE.
SUBDIVISION 1. ADOPTION BY REFERENCE.
Sec. 9-101. Code- Adoption by Reference.

The National Electrical Code (NEC), [2002] 2014 Edition, published by the National Fire
Protection Assdciation, is hereby adopted by reference and made a part of this Subtitle with the
same force and effect as though set out in full herein as the Official Electrical Code of Prince
George's County, together with the changes, deletions, or modifications prescribed in this
Subtitle. All electrical work performed or contracted to be performed in the County shall be
included within the [purview] authority of this Subtitle.

* * ® * * * * *

Sec. 9-104. General.

Any provision of the National Electrical Code adopted by Section 9-101 of this Subtitle

shall be subject to [changed, modified, added or omitted] change. modification, addition or

omission as set out in Subdivision 2, and such change, amendment, addition or deletion shall be
deemed to supersede the text of the Electrical Code in any case where the provisions of this
Subtitle are interpreted.
Sec. 9-104.01. Same; Article 110 -- Requirements for Electrical Installations.
(a) The following amendments, additions, and/or deletions are made to Section 110.26 of
the National Electrical Code:
(1) Section 110.26(D), "Illumination," is amended to read as follows: In addition to

Article 110.26 (D) a wall mounted battery pack operated emergency illumination shall be

provided for all working spaces about service equipment, switchboards, panelboards, load

centers and motor control centers installed indoors. The battery shall be of suitable rating and

capacity to supply and maintain the total load for a minimum period of 2 hours. In addition,







o 00 1 N W s W R

—_ =
o = O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

CB-91-2015 (DR-1)

(1) The following paragraph is added to Section [310.2, "Conductors:" (C)] 310.10
“Uses Permitted.” Aluminum Conductors. Aluminum conductors shall be permitted only for
service and feeder use and shall not be smaller than #2 AWG.

(2) The following exception is added to Section [310.2, "Conductors:"] 310.10 “Uses
Permitted.” Listed Cable assemblies #2 aluminum AWG and larger installed in single-family

and multifamily dwellings, having grounding conductors sized in accordance with Section
250.122, "Size of Equipment Grounding Conductors," shall be excluded from the requirements
set forth in (a)(1), above.

[3) The following addition is made to 310.15(B)(2)(a)FPN, "Adjustment Factors:"
No diversity allowance is permitted when determining ampacity of three (3) or more conductors

in a raceway or cable.]

* ik * * ® * % *

Sec. 9-108.01. Same; Article 408-Switchboards and Panelboards.
(a) The following amendments, additions, and/or deletions are made to Article 408 of the
National Electrical Code:
(1) Article [480.16] 408.36, "Overcurrent Protection," Exception No. [2 under

paragraph (A)] 3 is amended to read as follows:

* # * & # * * *

(2) A new Section [408.22], Article 408, Part II. A switchboard. 408.23 titled
“Switchboards of One Thousand (1.000) Amperes or Larger.” [titled "Switchboards of One
Thousand (1,000) Amperes or Larger,] is added to read as follows:

(A) Switchboards having a capacity of one thousand (1,000) amperes or larger,
using aluminum feeders and/or busbars, shall receive periodic cleaning and preventative
maintenance as recommended by the manufacturer of such equipment to minimize the possibility
of fire or catastrophic failure. Cleaning and maintenance require an electrical permit, including
coordination of shutdown with the utility, and shall include the following:

* * * * % * # *

(viii) Testing and cleaning records shall be kept and made available upon

request and proper antioxidizing agents shall be used after each cleaning.

% % * % * * * #



















W00 =1 v L B W b

| I O B O e T e e e e e VO VS Y
L S =T = T - - T I S O T U 7S R o T =

CB-91-2015 (DR-1)

Sec. 9-110. Emergency and Power Source.

(a) The following amendments and/or additions are made to Article 700 of National

Electrical Code.
(1) A connection ahead of service disconnecting means is not permitted as an

emergency circuit except as permitted by Section 9-109.01 of this Code.

Sec. 9-111. Fire Pump.
(a) The following amendments, and/or additions are made to Article 695 of the National
Electrical Code:
(1) A fire pump shall be supplied by a separate service from the utility

transformer.

(2) A fire pump shall be permitted to be supplied from a connection located

ahead of the service disconnecting means when a back-up on-site generator

is used as an alternate power source to feed the fire pump.
SECTION 4. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby

declared to be severable; and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,

sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining
words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this
Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, subparagraph, subsection,
or section.

SECTION 5. BEIT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.

10









CB-091-2015(Draft 1) Page2 of 2

The Office of Law determined that CB-91-2015 was in proper legislative form with no legal impediments to its
enactment.

The Office of Audits and Investigation indicated there should not be any negative fiscal impact on the County as a
result of enactment CB-91-2015.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION/FISCAL IMPACT:
(Includes reason for proposal, as well as any unique statutory requirements)

This legislation will update the Prince George’s County Electrical Ordinance by adopting amendments pursuant to the
2014 Edition of the National Electrical Code. Prince George’s County is required to update the local Electrical Code
and amend certain sections of the Prince County Code to include modifications related to the Electrical Code. These
amendments ensure enhanced safety for residents, workers within and visitors to Prince George’s County.

CODE INDEX TOPICS:

INCLUSION FILES:
















= W

CB-49-2015 (DR-4)

Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, subparagraph, paragraph, subsection,
or section.
SECTION 3. BEIT FURTHER ENACTED, that this Act shall take on April 1, 2016.
Adopted this 17th day of November, 2015.

COUNTY COUNCIL OF PRINCE
GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

gz

BY:
Mel Franklin
Chairman
ATTEST:
% &&LC%? 1
Redis C. Floyd
Clerk of the Council
APPROVED:

DATE: (2 E 221 ‘E BY(ELJ L/Q/W

Rushern L. Baker, I1I
County Executive













oy

('] L 2 o ] g (R [ ] o 3] o 2 ot —_— —_ — [ [— — [— — —
- B« O N o N s = JENUs S = B B N O S D2 = O W 00 1 O W B W

CB-50-2015 (DR-2)

oversight as it relates to Common Ownership Communities; that there is a lack of homeowner
education with regard to the real estate process, governance, enforcement procedures, and
resolution of disputes; that there exists a misunderstanding amongst homeowners of the
responsibilities of the developer/builder as it relates to the establishment and direction of an
efficiently operated homeowner association/Common Ownership Community; and that in order
to effectively respond, the County Council for Prince George’s County, Maryland hereby
declares that it is the public policy of Prince George’s County to establish a program to assist in
addressing the needs of Common Ownership Communities by providing education, training and
dispute mediation services through the Common Ownership Communities Program.
Sec. 13-315. Common Ownership Communities Program.

~ (a) There is hereby established a Common Ownership Communities Program. The
Common Ownership Communities Program shall be administered by the Director of the Office
of Community Relations.

(b) Rules and regulations, consistent with the purpose and spirit of the Common
Ownership Communities Program, shall be promulgated by the County Executive, subject to
County Council approval by resolution. Said rules and regulations shall govern the
implementation and administration of the Common Ownership Communities Program.

Sec. 13-316. Definitions.
As used in this Division:
(a) Common Ownership Community means:
(1) A condominium, as defined pursuant to state law;
(2) A cooperative housing corporation, as defined pursuant to state law; or
(3) A homeowners association, as defined pursuant to state law.
(b) Director means the Director of the Office of Community Relations.
(c) Office means the Office of Community Relations.
Sec. 13-317. Director; duties and responsibilities.

(a) The Director shall have operational responsibility for carrying out the duties prescribed
in this Division and for enforcing the provisions of this Division.

(b) The Director is authorized to:

(1) research, assemble, analyze and disseminate pertinent data and educational

materials about activities and programs which assist Common Ownership Communities; plan






ds W b

O oo - N Ln

10
11
12
13
14
15

CB-50-2015 (DR-2)

[(b)] (c) The governing body of a [homeowners’ association, the council of unit owners of
a condominium and the board of directors of a cooperative housing corporation] community

association are responsible for compliance with this subsection.

(d) By ordinance. the County may impose a fee to provide administrative hearing services
for the resolution of disputes involving Common Ownership Community located in the County.

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that the provisions of this Act are hereby
declared to be severable; and, in the event that any section, subsection, paragraph, subparagraph,
sentence, clause, phrase, or word of this Act is declared invalid or unconstitutional by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the remaining
words, phrases, clauses, sentences, subparagraphs, paragraphs, subsections, or sections of this
Act, since the same would have been enacted without the incorporation in this Act of any such
invalid or unconstitutional word, phrase, clause, sentence, paragraph, subparagraph, subsection,
or section.

SECTION 3. BE IT FURTHER ENACTED that this Act shall take effect forty-five (45)

calendar days after it becomes law.















0 1 v L B W

CB-58-2015 (DR-3)

are hereby repealed and reenacted with the following amendments:
SUBTITLE 13. HOUSING AND PROPERTY STANDARDS.
DIVISION 11. COMMON OWNERSHIP COMMUNITIES PROGRAM.
Sec. 13-314. Legislative findings and declaration of purpose.

The County Council for Prince George’s County, Maryland, hereby finds that Prince
George’s County is facing significant issues with respect to the lack of management and
oversight as it relates to Common Ownership Communities; that there is a lack of homeowner
education with regard to the real estate process, governance, enforcement procedures, and
resolution of disputes; that there exists a misunderstanding amongst homeowners of the
responsibilities of the developer/builder as it relates to the establishment and direction of an
efficiently operated homeowner association/Common Ownership Community; and that in order
to effectively respond, the County Council for Prince George’s County, Maryland hereby
declares that it is the public policy of Prince George’s County to establish a program to assist in
addressing the needs of Common Ownership Communities by providing education, training and
alternative dispute mediation services through the Common Ownership Communities Program.
Sec. 13-316. Definitions.

As used in this Division:

(a) Alternative Dispute Resolution means a process for people in conflict. which

includes two or more participants, and one or two trained alternative dispute resolution

specialists.
(b) Alternative Dispute Resolution Specialist(s) are trained. impartial people who help

people in conflict to communicate with one another, understand each other. explore options for

mutual gain. and if possible. reach agreements that satisfy the participants’ needs. An alternative

dispute resolution specialist(s) does not provide lecal advice.

(c) Association Document means:

(1) The master deeds. declaration. incorporation documents, bylaws. and rules of any

common ownership community:;

(2) Any written private agreement between any parties concerning the operation of
the community or maintenance or control of common or limited common property: and

(3) Any similar document concerning the operation or governance of a common

ownership community.







[0S ] (] —

Ia

O 00 ~J1 Oy ta

CB-58-2015 (DR-3)

association documents against any person that is subiject to those documents.

(i) Dispute does not include any disagreement that only involves:

(1) Title to any unit or any common element;

(2) The percentage interest or vote allocable to a unit;

(3) The interpretation or enforcement of any warranty;

(4) The collection of an assessment validly levied against a party: or

(5) The exercise of a governing body’s judgment or discretion in taking or deciding

not to take anv legally authorized action.

() Governing body of a community association means the council of unit owners. board

of directors. or any other body authorized by an association document to adopt binding rules or

regulations.

[(c)] (k) Office means the Office of Community Relations.
(I) Owner includes:

(1) A unit owner in a condominium;

(2) A lot owner in a homeowners association: and

(3) A member of a cooperative housing corporation.

(m) Party includes:
(1) An Owner;

(2) A Governing body: and
(3) An occupant of a dwelling unit in a common ownership community.

(n) Unit or Lot includes:

(1) Any physical portion of a common ownership community with distinct property

boundaries that:

(A) Provides complete. independent living facilities for one or more individuals:

(B) Contains permanent provisions for living. sleeping. eating. cooking. and

sanitation: and

(C) Is designated for exclusive ownership. control. or occupancy by those

individuals: and
(2) All legally enforceable rights and interests incidental to individual ownership of

real property in a common ownership community.
SECTION 2. BE IT ENACTED by the County Council of Prince George's County,













Prince George's County Council
Agenda Item Summary

Meeting Date: 11/17/2015

Reference No.: CB-058-2015

Draft No.: 3

Proposer(s): Davis, Glaros, Tumer, Taveras

Sponsor(s): Davis, Glaros, Turner, Taveras, Lehman, Franklin, Patterson

Item Title: An Act concerning the Common Ownership Communities Program for the purpose of

amending the Common Ownership Communities Program to assist governing bodies, owners,
and residents of homeowners’ associations, residential condominiums, and cooperative
housing corporations with education, training, and dispute resolution and/or administrative
hearing procedures in matters relating to these communities; and generally regarding
Common Ownership Communities.

Drafter: Kathleen H. Canning, Legislative Officer
Resource Personnel: Nellvenia W. Johnson,Chief of Staff

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY:

Date Presented: 7/21/2015 Executive Action: 12/10/2015 US
Committee Referral: 7/21/2015 - THE Effective Date: 1/25/2016
Committee Action: 10/15/2015 - FAV(A)

Date Introduced: 10/20/2015

Public Hearing: 11/17/2015 - 10:00 AM

Council Action (1) 11/17/2015 - ENACTED

Council Votes: DLD:A, MRF:A, DG:A, AH:A, ML:A, OP:A, DT:A, KT:A, TT:A

Pass/Fail: P

Reémarks:

AFFECTED CODE SECTIONS:
13-314, 13-316, 13-319, 13-320, 13-321, 13-322, 13-323, 13-324, 13-325, 13-326, 13-327, 13-328

COMMITTEE REPORTS:
TRANSPORTATION. HOUSING AND THE ENVIRONMENT COMMITTEE Date 10/15/2015
*REVISED*

Committee Vote: Favorable with Amendments, 5-0 (In favor: Council Members Lehman, Turner, Glaros, Franklin
and Taveras)

The Legislative Officer provided a summary of the bill and referral comments that were received. CB-538-201 5 AN
ACT CONCERNING THE COMMON OWNERSHIP COMMUNITIES PROGRAM for the purpose of amending
the Common Ownership Communities Program to assist governing bodies, owners, and residents of homeowners’
associations, residential condominiums, and cooperative housing corporations with education, training, and dispute
resolution and/or administrative hearing procedures in matters relating to these communities; and generally regarding
Common Ownership Communities.









